
 
 
 
 
 
 

Seth A. Rosenthal 

T 202.344.4741 
F 202.344.8300 

sarosenthal@venable.com 
 

November 11, 2022 
 
Mayor and City Council of Baltimore  
Attn:  James Shea, City Solicitor 
City Hall, Suite 101 
100 Holliday Street 
Baltimore, MD 21202 
 
Police Department of Baltimore City 
Attn:  Michael Harrison, Police Commissioner 
242 W 29th Street 
Baltimore, MD 21211-2908  
 
Timothy Mygatt 
Nicole Porter 
U.S. Department of Justice 
Civil Rights Division 
Special Litigation Section 
950 Pennsylvania Ave., NW 
Washington, DC 20530 
 
 RE: Baltimore Police Monitoring Team – September 2022 Invoice 
 
 This document, including attachments, is the invoice of the Baltimore Police Monitoring Team 
(“Team”) for services performed and expenses incurred in September 2022. 
 
Narrative Summary 
   

This invoice accounts for time worked from September 1 – September 30, 2022, by Team 
members Ken Thompson, Seth Rosenthal, Theron Bowman, Randy Dupont, Hassan Aden, Matthew 
Barge, Jessica Drake, Maggie Goodrich, Joyce Nola, Megan McDonough, Charles Ramsey, Sean 
Smoot, Sue Rahr, Terri Wilfong, Roberto Villasenor, Katie Zafft, Gabriela Wasileski, and Wanda 
Watts. This invoice also includes expenses for the rental of office space from the City (for which the 
City reimburses the Monitoring Team). 

 
The sum of previously unbilled services and expenses reflected in this invoice is $124,960.42 

Of the time submitted in this invoice, 84.6 hours, or 18%, were pro bono, or unbilled and donated to 
the City of Baltimore. By recording 18% of its total time pro bono, and writing off certain expenses, 
the Team saved the city a total of $28,209.00. 
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Work performed in September 2022 included: 
 

• Community outreach and meetings between Monitoring Team members, including 
neighborhood liaisons, and community stakeholders, including by Facebook Live, and 
collaborations with BPD and DOJ regarding coordinated outreach 

• Collaborating with Morgan State University to conduct a second community survey, the Munk 
School and Rose Street Community Center to prepare for a second custodial arrestee survey, 
and the Criminal Justice Institute on the report for a second series of officer focus groups 
conducted in May 

• Virtual and telephonic meetings regarding Consent Decree requirements on stops/searches/ 
arrests, use of force, interactions with individuals with behavioral health disabilities, 
technology and data collection and maintenance, interactions with youth, impartial policing, 
misconduct investigations and discipline, training, sexual assault investigations, First 
Amendment protected activities, supervision, staffing, recruitment, hiring, officer assistance 
and support, compliance reviews and outcome assessments  

• Continuing our comprehensive assessment on use of force for 2018 – 2020 
• Continuing our comprehensive assessment on sexual assault investigations in 2019 – 2020  
• Continuing our comprehensive assessment on arrests from 2019 and 2021 
• Continuing our review of the quality of PIB investigations from 2021 
• Continuing our comprehensive assessment on officer wellness 
• Developing methodologies for assessments on recruitment, hiring/retention, First Amendment 

compliance, and responses to individuals in crisis 
• Conducting audits of transport events and transport equipment 
• Work on revisions to BPD policies on the disciplinary process  
• Providing technical assistance on curriculum for training on community policing and 

misconduct/discipline  
• Observing or evaluating Collaborative Planning and Implementation Committee (CPIC) 

meetings; Performance Review Board meetings; and Comstat and RecruitStat meetings 
• Providing technical assistance to BPD’s Public Integrity Bureau, including development of 

intake testing program 
• Providing technical assistance on implementation of technology reforms, including 

implementation of new Records Management System and a revised electronic report form 
• Reviewing and providing feedback on BPD self-assessment of release-without-charge arrests 
• Addressing issues relating to interactions with individuals with behavioral health disabilities, 

including meetings with CPIC, behavioral health system deficiencies identified in an analysis 
of systemic needs (including progress on implementation of GBRICS program), evaluating data 
on crisis response, and BPD’s Crisis Intervention Team 

• Reviewing implementation of community policing plan 
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• Consulting BPD on staffing plan 
• Consulting BPD on implementing recruitment and retention incentives 
• Preparing FY23 budget 
• Meetings and communications with Judge Bredar to inform him and receive his feedback about 

the progress of the project 
• Preparing and updating content for the team’s website 
• Engaging with residents on social media 

 
Invoice Summary 
 
Invoice Totals 
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Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 

 
Individual Invoices and Supporting Documentation 
 
 The remainder of this invoice includes the individual invoices of all Team members who 
submitted invoices for September 2022, as well as receipts for travel, transportation, accommodations, 
and expenses incurred for website development, and establishment of Team e-mail addresses.  
 
 The City and the Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for meals 
and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Baltimore for work on the project will do so at the 
standard federal per diem rate of $69, with fractions of days billed at 75% of the standard federal per 
diem rate, or $51.75.  Some team members have waived or reduced their per diem charges or elected to 
receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to and working in Baltimore.  This 
constitutes additional, ongoing savings to the City. 

September
Total 
Hours

Billed 
Hours

Pro 
Bono 
Hours

Total 
Services 
Billed

Total 
Expenses 
Billed 

Rosenthal 89.2 69.6 19.6 $33,060.00 $0.00
Thompson 66.5 51.4 15.1 $24,415.00 $0.00
Aden 26.9 26 0.9 $6,110.00 $0.00
Barge 39.3 35.9 3.4 $8,436.50 $364.11
Bowman 3.5 3.5 0 $822.50 $0.00
CJI: Wasileski 25 25 0 $5,875.00 $0.00
CJI: Zafft 7.5 7.5 0 $1,275.00 $0.00
Drake (CE) 1 1 0 $235.00 $0.00
Drake (Admin) 2.5 2.5 0 $93.75 $0.00
Dupont 36.8 18.9 17.9 $4,441.50 $982.96
Goodrich 1 1 0 $235.00 $0.00
McDonough 50.9 42.2 8.7 $9,917.00 $587.17
Joyce 16.8 16.8 0 $3,948.00 $209.55
Rahr 9 9 0 $2,115.00 $0.00
Ramsey 13 13 0 $3,055.00 $0.00
Smoot 4.3 4.3 0 $1,010.50 $0.00
Villasenor 60.2 41.2 19 $9,682.00 $1,721.88
Watts 13.5 13.5 0 $3,172.50 $0.00
Wilfong 9.5 9.5 0 $2,232.50 $0.00
Otis Warren 
Mgmt. Co. 0 0 0 $0.00 $963.00
Total 476.4 391.8 84.6 $120,131.75 $4,828.67
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 We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and the City of Baltimore.  
As previously discussed, we ask both parties to review the invoice and get back to us with any 
comments or suggested changes within five days.  Once we obtain approval of the invoice, we will 
submit it to Judge James Bredar for his review and approval. 

 
Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 

 
      Sincerely, 

       
      Seth Rosenthal 
      Deputy Monitor 



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: September

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Thompson
DATE SUBMITTED: 10/6/2022

YEAR: 2022

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate Total

Unbilled 
Hours

September 1 2.7 475.00$              1,282.50$                 0.8

September 2 475.00$              -$                           
September 3 475.00$              -$                           
September 4 475.00$              -$                           

September 5 475.00$              -$                           
September 6 3.1 475.00$              1,472.50$                 1

September 7 2.5 475.00$              1,187.50$                 1.2

September 8 6.4 475.00$              3,040.00$                 

September 9 2.8 475.00$              1,330.00$                 1.1

September 10 475.00$              -$                           

September 11 475.00$              -$                           
September 12 3.8 475.00$              1,805.00$                 1

September 13 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 1.3

September 14 2.3 475.00$              1,092.50$                 

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

Review community engagement schedule; work on logistics for upcoming 
monthly meeting

Work on community engagement schedule; begin working on logistics for the 
October Quarterly Public Hearing

Review materials in preparation for tomorrow night’s community meeting; 
work on logistics for both next week’s monthly meeting and the October 

 

Review materials in connection with Performance Standards Section; finalize 
logistics for Thursday’s monthly meeting; review select staffing materials

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Review materials related to outstanding deliverables under the 5th Year Monitoring Plan and meet 
with S Rosenthal and R DuPont re: same; review Monitoring Team Submission; work on probable 
cause assessments; continue to evaluate community survey issues 

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Work on probable cause assessments; review multiple communications and engage in conversations 
with S Rosenthal re: community survey issues 

Review materials and participate in conference call with S Rosenthal and M McDonough re: 
community survey issues; work on probable cause assessments; review 24 Hour Report re: Transport 
Injury 
Continue to review materials in the area of youth interventions in preparation for next week’s 
monthly meeting; continue working on community survey issues; review Attrition Report 

Review issue regarding Inspector General/Police Records issue and report 
back to Judge re: same; work on logistics for next week’s monthly meeting

Work on logistics for this week’s monthly meeting with the court; engage in 
multiple communications with the Court re: community engagement issues
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Participate in weekly community engagement meeting; participate in multiple communications with 
R DuPont  re: behavioral crisis issues; meet with J Bredar re: community engagement issues; review 
and analyze materials and communications re: community survey issues prepare for and participate 
in community meeting with Northwest Faith Partners 

Description 

Work on probable cause assessments; prepare for and attend Auchentoroly Terrace Community 
meeting 
Review Parties’ Submissions along with related materials; work on probable cause assessments; 
review materials re: Paragraph 97 issues 

Work on probable cause arrest assessments; continue to review and evaluate community survey 
issues; prepare for tomorrow’s monthly meeting 
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September 15 3.6 475.00$              1,710.00$                 1.2

September 16 475.00$              -$                           
September 17 475.00$              -$                           
September 18 475.00$              -$                           

September 19 1.2 475.00$              570.00$                    0.6
September 20 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 0.7

September 21 2.4 475.00$              1,140.00$                 0.8

September 22 3.3 475.00$              1,567.50$                 

September 23 1.4 475.00$              665.00$                    1

September 24 475.00$              -$                           
September 25 475.00$              -$                           

September 26 1.8 475.00$              855.00$                    1.1
September 27 0.6 475.00$              285.00$                    0.7
September 28 4.2 475.00$              1,995.00$                 1.3

September 29 1.3 475.00$              617.50$                    0.6

September 30 475.00$              -$                           0.7
475.00$              -$                           

51.4 475.00$              24,415.00$              15.1

Discuss Consent Decree issues with University of Memphis graduate students
Work on administrative issues

Work on community engagement schedule; work on logistics for the October 
Public hearing; Conference with the Court re: community survey

Review material re: personnel changes, including residency requirements and 
communicate with the Court re: same; work on community engagement 

Review draft budget; work on community engagement assignments

Work on probable cause assessments; review 1st Amendment materials 
Multiple conversations with R DuPont re: Behavioral Crisis issues and assessments
Begin reviewing draft of Use of Force Assessment; continue working on probable cause assessments;  
review CPIC Data Subcommittee meeting notes 

Prepare for and attend monthly meeting

Work on logistics for monthly meeting

Review memo re: community survey and related materials; review 911 Diversion Report 
Prepare for and attend Court conference re: the community survey and meet with court and parties 
after same; work on probable cause assessments 
Work on probable cause arrest assessments; continue to review draft memorandum confirming 
agreement reached re: community survey 
Work on probable cause arrest assessments; review 1st Amendment materials in preparation for 
upcoming monthly meeting 
Work on probable cause assessments; review final version of the confirmation memorandum re: the 
community survey 

Work on probable cause assessments

Work on logistics for upcoming monthly meeting; review select sections of the 
5th Year Monitoring Plan

Review and provide comments to community survey memorandum to the 
parties; re-review materials in connection with paragraph 97 issues
Begin working on logistics for next month's public hearing

Work on logistics for Public Hearing



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

Yes -$                     -$                               

Yes -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS
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No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               
TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 24,415.00$                      
Subtotal Expenses: -$                                  

TOTAL: 24,415.00$                      
Unbilled Hours 15.10

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: KLT
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Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.

INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: September

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Rosenthal

DATE SUBMITTED: 10/6/2022

YEAR: 2022

Sample Description:

TIME 

Month of Day Hours  Rate Total
Unbilled 

Hours

September 1 4.8 475.00$             2,280.00$                

2

September 2 6.4 475.00$             3,040.00$                

September 3 475.00$             -$                         

1.5

September 4 475.00$             -$                         

September 5 0.5 475.00$             237.50$                   
0.3

September 6 5.2 475.00$             2,470.00$                

0.4

September 7 1.5 475.00$             712.50$                   

0.2

September 8 3.5 $475.00 1,662.50$                

0.3

September 9 1.4 475.00$             665.00$                   

0.2

September 10 475.00$             -$                         

September 11 1.4 475.00$             665.00$                   

Arrest compliance reviews; telephone conference/emails with Judge Bredar and Thompson re 

community survey; meeting with BPD and MT assessments team re Axon records report form and 

emails with MT assessments team re same 

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 

will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 

a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.

6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 

Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

Attention to community survey issues

Emails with Thompson and McDonough re community survey and review past 

correspondence re same

Emails with Thompson and McDonough re community survey

Emails with BPD re evidence.com access issues; emails re report writing

Emails with Munk School re community survey

Emails re sex assault case flagged for potential unconstitutional detention

Emails with Thompson re CD and PIA requests and review complaint re 

BPD/City PIA request responses

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Telephone conference with Judge Bredar, Thompson, IUR, DOJ and BPD re community survey; arrest 

compliance reviews; draft email for BPD re suggested changes to Axon records report form  and share 

with assessments team for comments

Arrest compliance reviews 

Draft letter to IUR re community survey and confer with Thompson and McDonough re same ; arrest 

compliance reviews; emails with BPD re suggestions for modifications to Axon report form; email to 

team leads re drafting next report 

Begin review of outstanding monitoring plan deliverables and emails with court re same; review final 

draft of interim PIB assessment report and emails re same 

Review and emails with Judge Bredar/clerk and City/BPD and DOJ re outstanding monitoring plan 

deliverables

Assessments team call; arrest compliance reviews; finalize and transmit letter to IUR re community 

survey 

Review and comment on updated draft of public order forces training curriculum and emails with BPD 

and DOJ re same; revise letter to IUR on community survey and emails with Thompson and 

McDonough re same 

Description 
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September 12 6.3 475.00$             2,992.50$                

1.1

September 13 4.9 475.00$             2,327.50$                

1.3

September 14 6.4 475.00$             3,040.00$                

2

September 15 5 475.00$             2,375.00$                

1.5

September 16 4.6 475.00$             2,185.00$                

2.5

September 17 3.8 475.00$             1,805.00$                

September 18 0.6 475.00$             285.00$                   
0.8

September 19 2.8 475.00$             1,330.00$                

1.2

September 20 4.6 475.00$             2,185.00$                

2.7

September 21 3.9 475.00$             1,852.50$                

0.7

September 22 0.5 475.00$             237.50$                   

0.6

September 23 0.5 475.00$             237.50$                   

0.3

September 24 0.5 475.00$             237.50$                   

September 25 0.5 475.00$             237.50$                   

September 26 475.00$             -$                         

September 27 475.00$             -$                         

September 28 475.00$             -$                         

September 29 475.00$             -$                         

September 30 475.00$             -$                         

September 31 475.00$             -$                         

69.6 475.00$             33,060.00$              19.6

Prepare FY23 budget and confer with Aden re same

Emails re UOF compliance assessment; emails re Brady-Giglio training

Telephone conference with DOJ re community survey; emails with Judge 

Bredar re Sept 20 conference on community survey; emails with MT leadership 

and court re article on monitorships; emails re arrestee survey and review 

proposed methodology

Confer with Thompson re various; emails re website updates; emails re 

arrestee survey methodology; weekly community engagement team meeting

Emails with MT, IUR, DOJ and BPD re upcoming court meeting re community 

survey; emails with Drake re website updates; Barge emails re status report on 

UOF compliance assessment; arrest compliance reviews

Emails re UOF compliance assessment report; emails with IUR and parties re 

community survey resolution

Emails re UOF compliance review, Brady-Giglio training, and 2022 E&T 

legislative update

Emails with DOJ re community survey; arrest compliance reviews

Work FY23 budget and email with Aden re same

Emails with court, IUR, BPD and DOJ re upcoming meeting on community 

survey meeting; emails with Aden re FY23 budget

Telephone conference with Aden re FY23 budget and email proposed budget to 

BPD and DOJ; travel to/from meeting with court; emails re PRB training 

curriculum; cursory review of Q2 2022 RWOC arrest report

Review Brady-Giglio training module and email with DOJ re same

Arrest compliance reviews and emails with MT reviewers re issues encountered; emails with Judge 

Bredar, clerk and BPD/City re monitoring plan deliverables; telephone conference with Thompson and 

Dupont re 911 diversion protocol and systemic reform implementation plan reports 

Arrest compliance reviews; emails with BPD and DOJ re community survey; draft court submission for 

interim PIB assessment and emails re same; finalize 1st A assessment methodology and emails with 

BPD and DOJ re same 

Arrest compliance reviews and emails with MT reviewers re same; review and comment on 

assignments and records to request for 1st A compliance review; emails with Barge re information for 

UOF compliance assessment 

Participate in monthly meeting with court, BPD/City and DOJ (behavioral health, youth and school 

police); arrest compliance reviews; review and emails with Barge re paragraph 412, 215, 216 

requirements in UOF section of Decree

Draft memo for Judge Bredar re community survey and emails with McDonough and Judge Bredar re 

same; arrest compliance reviews 

Review and comment on use of force compliance assessment report

Emails with DOJ and MT re memo on latest adjustment to Axon Records fields; finalize and circulate 

memo agreement on community survey 

Emails with parties re 1st Amendment compliance assessment; review draft use of force compliance 

assessment report 

Meeting with court, IUR and parties re community survey; draft memo reflecting agreement reached at 

meeting; emails with Barge et al re draft of use of force compliance assessment report; cursory review 

of draft of SSA data report and email with Bowman re same 

Arrest compliance reviews; finalize and emails with MT, DOJ, BPD and IUR re draft agreement on 

community survey 

Video call with parties re records needed for 1st A compliance review

Call with BPD and DOJ re latest adjustments to Axon Records fields

Review and comment on memo re latest adjustments to Axon Records fields
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EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 

Incidentals (per 

daily Guidelines 

cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 

Description

Non-Meal 

Expense
Total

Yes -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 33,060.00$                     

Subtotal Expenses: -$                                

TOTAL: 33,060.00$                     

Unbilled Hours 19.60

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: SAR

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non‐reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: September

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Bowman
DATE SUBMITTED: 10/11/2022

YEAR: 2022

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate  Total

Unbilled 
Hours

September 1 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 2 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 3 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 4 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 5 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 6 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 7 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 8 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 9 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

September 10 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 11 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 12 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 13 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 14 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 15 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 16 1.5 235.00$               352.50$                    

September 17 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 18 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 19 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 20 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 21 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 22 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 23 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 24 235.00$               ‐$                           

Reviewed and responded to 17 messages (Outstanding Monitoring Plan Deliverables, Arrest compliance 
reviews and form ‐ Issues of Note encountered, media reports, Line 17 SSA Data Progress Report)
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Comments (Unbilled Time)

Reviewed and responded to 11  messages(Report writing time again!, policy 1605: Location Services, Arrest 
PC cases ‐ Batch 1, SSA Policies Re‐Review)

Description 

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in‐service training; meet with Ms. Williams re changes to 
compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 



September 25 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 26 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 27 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 28 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 29 235.00$               ‐$                           
September 30 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

3.5 822.50$                     0

Reviewed and responded to 9 messages(Line16 Quarterly RWOC Report Q2 2022, Presentation Request: 
Friday October 28, 2022 2pm (Virtual), Line 17 SSA Dar=ta Progress Report, Mew Policy: 1745 ‐ Equity Office)



EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non‐Meal 
Description

Non‐Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               
TOTAL: ‐$                               

Subtotal Time: 822.50$                            
Subtotal Expenses: ‐$                                   

TOTAL: 822.50$                            
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: TLB



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900

Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non‐reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: September

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Dupont
DATE SUBMITTED: 10/6/2022

YEAR: 2022

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day  Rate  Total

Unbilled 
Hours

September 1 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 2 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 3 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 4 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 5 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 6 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

September 7 235.00$               ‐$                            0.66

September 8 1.1 235.00$               258.50$                    

September 9 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

September 10 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 11 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 12 2.6 235.00$               611.00$                     0.64
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Development and writing on Court Report for Meeting with Consent Decree Parties

Comments (Unbilled Time)

CPIC Data Committee Meeting to review BPD Quarterly Data Report

Discussison with CD Parties on Implementation Report

Discussion with BPD Compliance Division on BPD Data Report

Description 

Discussion with Monitor K Thompson regarding CD Paragraph 97.

Meeting with Deputy Monitor S. Rosenthal to discuss City Gaps Analysis 
Implementatin Report, Discussion of 911 Expansion Report with BPD 
Compliance Division.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.
7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in‐service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

September 13 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 14 235.00$               ‐$                            7

September 15 6 235.00$               1,410.00$                  2

September 16 235.00$               ‐$                            5.5

September 17 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 18 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 19 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 20 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

September 21 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 22 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 23 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 24 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 25 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 26 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 27 4 235.00$               940.00$                     2.1

September 28 235.00$               ‐$                           

September 29 1.7 235.00$               399.50$                    

September 30 0.5 235.00$               117.50$                    

September 31 235.00$               ‐$                           

18.9 235.00$               4,441.50$                  17.9

CPIC Full Membership Monthly Meeting, CPIC Policy Committee Meeting regarding GBRICS progress

Review of Court Report and Preparation of Court Presentation, Court Consent Decree Hearing

Discussion with Monitor K Thompson regarding recent BPD Progress, Meeting 
with Monitoring Team Data Group, M. Barge and M. McDonough to review 
Outcome Methodology.

CPIC Data Committee Meeting to review current BPD Quarterly Data Report and plan for next 
Quarterly Data Report

Bhavioral Health Meeting to review progress with BPD, DOJ and City, review of progess with CD 
Parties

Review of media sources on BPD critical event

Monitoring Team Meeting with Monitor K. Thompson, Deputy Monitor S. 
Rosenthal, MT Member Robero Villasenor

Travel Time from Baltimore

Travel Time to Baltimore



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

EXPENSES

Date Category Vendor Comment Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non‐Meal 
Description

Non‐Meal 
Expense

Total

9/14/2022 Transportation mileage Home to Airport Mileage one way x .625=$6.25 Yes  mileage  6.25$                     6.25$                             

9/14/2022 Air Delta Airlines Memphis to Baltimore Receipt #1 note requested rate Yes ‐$                      airfare  391.00$                391.00$                         

9/14/2022 Transportation BWI Taxi Airport to Marriott Inner Harbor at Camden Yards Receipt #2 Yes ‐$                      taxi  40.00$                   40.00$                           

9/14/2022 Other per diem Partial Day rate of $53.25 Yes  per diem  53.25$                   53.25$                           

9/15/2022 Other per diem Full Day rate of $71 No 69.00$                  per diem  71.00$                   71.00$                           

9/16/2022 Lodging Marriott Inner Harbor Two Night Stay Receipt #3, government rate Yes ‐$                      hotel  321.96$                321.96$                         

9/16/2022 Other per diem Partial Day rate of $53.25 Yes ‐$                      per diem  $53.25 53.25$                           

9/16/2022 Transportation Taxi Marriott Inner Harbor to Airport Receipt #4 Yes ‐$                      taxi  40.00$                   40.00$                           

9/16/2022 Transportation Mileage Airport to Home one way 10 miles x .625=$6.25 Yes #REF!  mileage  6.25$                     6.25$                             

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               
TOTAL: 982.96$                         

Subtotal Time: 4,441.50$                         
Subtotal Expenses: 982.96$                             Vendor #992110

TOTAL: 5,424.46$                         
Unbilled Hours 17.90 Invoice #105‐060

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: RTD















Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: September

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Wanda Watts
DATE SUBMITTED: 9/28/2022

YEAR: 2022

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate Total

Unbilled 
Hours

September 1 235.00$              -$                           
September 2 235.00$              -$                           
September 3 4.5 235.00$              1,057.50$                 
September 4 235.00$              -$                           
September 5 235.00$              -$                           
September 6 235.00$              -$                           
September 7 1 235.00$              235.00$                    
September 8 1.5 235.00$              352.50$                    
September 9 235.00$              -$                           
September 10 235.00$              -$                           
September 11 235.00$              -$                           
September 12 235.00$              -$                           
September 13 2 235.00$              470.00$                    
September 14 1 235.00$              235.00$                    
September 15 235.00$              -$                           
September 16 0.5 235.00$              117.50$                    
September 17 235.00$              -$                           
September 18 235.00$              -$                           
September 19 1 235.00$              235.00$                    
September 20 235.00$              -$                           
September 21 0.5 235.00$              117.50$                    
September 22 235.00$              -$                           
September 23 235.00$              -$                           
September 24 235.00$              -$                           
September 25 235.00$              -$                           
September 26 235.00$              -$                           
September 27 1.5 235.00$              352.50$                    
September 28 235.00$              -$                           
September 29 235.00$              -$                           

Description 
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Monthly CPIC//Graphics October Comm Forum

Monthly NL Meeting

Weekly Youth Diversion

Weekly Check-in//Northwest Faith Partners with Ken Thompson
Weekly Youth Diversion

Montlhly CDIU & MT Liaison Meeting

Weekly Youth Diversion
New Auchentoroly Terrace Association with Ken Thompson

Comments (Unbilled Time)

 Recovery Event at Shake & Bake

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 



September 30 235.00$              -$                           
September 31 235.00$              -$                           

13.5 3,172.50$                 0



EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

Yes -$                    -$                               

Yes -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               
TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 3,172.50$                         
Subtotal Expenses: -$                                   

TOTAL: 3,172.50$                         
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: WW



 
 

MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE 
C/O OTIS WARREN MANAGEMENT, INC 

2223 WHEATLEY DRIVE 
BALTIMORE, MD  21207 

 
 
 
 
 
 
CONSENT DECREE MONITORING TEAM OF BALTIMORE CITY 
ATTN:  SETH A. ROSENTHAL, ESQ. 
Venable LLP 
600 Massachusetts Avenue, NW 
Washington, DC  20001 
 
 
MAKE CHECK PAYABLE TO:  MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE 
                                                       C/O OTIS WARREN MANAGEMENT COMPANY, INC 
                                                        
 

 

 DATE                       DESCRIPTION                             AMOUNT 

 
09/14/22 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
Per Right of Enry Agreement Effective  09/01/2021 
 
RE:  2901 DRUID PARK DRIVE: 
         SUITES 200D & 200E -  321 Square Feet 
         For Office Space 
     
          
      RENT DUE:  August & September, 2022     
                              $481.50 Per Month 
                            
 
                                                                   Amount Due 
Remit to: 
              Mayor & City Council of Baltimore 
              C/O Otis Warren Management Company, Inc 
              2223 Wheatley Drive 
              Baltimore, MD 21207 
 
PLEASE CALL 410-539-1010 EXTN. 237 IF YOU HAVE ANY 
QUESTIONS.    
 

 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
  
 
 
    
 
$      963.00 
========== 

 Amount Due Within 30 Days  



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Aden Hassan
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

26.00 $235.00 $6,110.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Barge Matthew
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

35.90 $235.00 $8,436.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

25.00 $235.00 $5,875.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: CJI - Zafft Katie
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

7.50 $170.00 $1,275.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Drake Jessica - CE
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Drake Jessica -
Admin (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

2.50 $37.50 $93.75

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Goodrich Maggie
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Joyce Nola
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

16.80 $235.00 $3,948.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: McDonough Megan
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

42.20 $235.00 $9,917.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Ramsey Charles
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

13.00 $235.00 $3,055.00

From 21CP Solutions, LLC
332 S Michigan Ave. 
Suite 1032 – T615 
Chicago, IL 60604-4434 
(844) 767-2127

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Monitoring Team
Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor 
750 E. Pratt, Suite 900 
Baltimore, MD 21202

Invoice ID Baltimore Monitor September 2022 Invoice

Issue Date 10/11/2022

Due Date 11/10/2022 (Net 30)

Page 1 of 2



Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Smoot Sean
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

4.30 $235.00 $1,010.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Sue Rahr
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

9.00 $235.00 $2,115.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Terri Wilfong
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

9.50 $235.00 $2,232.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Villaseñor Roberto
(09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

41.20 $235.00 $9,682.00

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for Barge
Matthew (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $364.11 $364.11

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for Joyce
Nola (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $209.55 $209.55

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for
McDonough Megan (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $587.17 $587.17

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for
Villaseñor Roberto (09/01/2022 - 09/30/2022)

1.00 $1,721.88 $1,721.88

Amount Due $57,102.96

Page 2 of 2



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 26.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Aden Hassan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 26.00

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.50

 Participated in Compstat. Email and correspondence.

09/02/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.50

 CAll with N. POrter (DOJ) re: PIB assessment and other PIB and BPD related matters. Call with K. Thompson re:
CD related matters. Email and correspondence.

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.50

 Review of 24 Hour SIRT Report re Injured Prisoner. Email and correspondence re: various CD related matters and
project management.

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.50

 Budget preparation (2022-23). Call with M. Barge re: budget and outcome assessments. Call with K. Thompson re:
CD related matters and project management. Email and correspondence.

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.80

 Participated in CompStat. Call with K. Thompson re CD related matters. Review of draft PIB Review memo
addressing City and DOJ comments. Email and correspondence.

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.00

 Call with C. Ramsey re site visit TA and ongoing CD related matters. Follow up with K. Thompson on CD related
matters. Completed review and approval of PIB Review memo with plans to file it next week. Email and
correspondence.

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

Total 26.90
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 Bi-weekly meeting with the parties re PIB matters. Email and correspondence. Planning for upcoming site visit.

09/15/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

3.00

 Completed draft of 2023 MT Budget and distributed it to other MT leadership for edits/additions and comments.
Call with Outcome Assessment workgroup to discuss and amend the PIB Compliance Assessment methodology
and instrument for the 2023 assessment. Email and correspondence.

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Email and correspondence re CD related matters. Logistics and coordination for calls next week (DOJ, MT
workgroups and BPD Implementation Unit). Review and feedback on advanced budget draft.

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.00

 Call with S. Sullivan re CD related matters, including recent PIB assessments and the upcoming one for
compliance (2023). Email and correspondence.

09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Baltimore final review of draft budget going out to the parties for consideration. Call with S. Rosenthal re various
CD related deliverables, priorities and project management. Email and correspondence.

09/23/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.80

 Call with parties re Intake testing program updates.

09/29/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.00

 Participated in weekly Compstat meeting. Email and correspondence.

Pro Bono Hours 0.90

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.50

 Email and correspondence.

09/27/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.40

 Email and correspondence.

Total 26.90

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 39.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Barge Matthew

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 35.90

09/02/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.00

 Continue drafting and editing use of force assessment; various email communications w/ G. Wasileski re: same.

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.40

 Conference call w/ G. Wasileski re: use of force data analysis. Various email communciations w/ G. Wasileski re:
use of force data analysis, w/ S. Rosenthal re: investigative stop data system, semiannual report.

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

3.40

 Continue drafting, editing use of force assessment; various email communications w/ G. Wasileski re: same.

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

3.10

 Conference call w/ G. Wasileski re: use of force data analysis; various email communications w/ G. Wasileski, K.
Zafft, MT re: same, outcome assessment management. Continue drafting, editing use of force assessment.

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.70

 Continue drafting and editing use of force assessment; various email communications w/ G. Wasileski re: same.
Participate in weekly conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training; various email communications w/ BPD, DOJ,
MT re: same, various training topics.

09/14/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

7.20

 Continue drafting and editing use of force assessment; various email communications w/ G. Wasileski, K. Zafft, R.
Villaseñor, S. Rosenthal re: same. Various email communications w/ MT re: arrests assessment.

09/15/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.00

Total 39.30
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 Revise and edit draft report; email communications w/ G. Wasileski re: use of force data assessment. Conference
call w/ M. McDonough, H. Aden re: PIB assessment methodology.

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.10

 Revise and edit draft use of force assessment report; various email communications w/ S. Rosenthal, G. Wasileski,
R. Villaseñor, M. McDonough, K. Zafft re: same.

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.60

 Revise and edit draft use of force assessment report; email communciations w/ S. Rosenthal, G. Wasileski, R.
Villaseñor, M. McDonough re: same.

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.20

 Edit and revise use of force assessment report; email communications w/ G. Wasileski, S. Rosenthal, K. Zafft, M.
McDonough, R. Villaseñor, R. Dupont re: same, use of force data analysis, crisis intervention outcome assessment
methodology.

09/28/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

3.00

 Revise and edit use of force assessment report; email communications w/ S. Rosenthal, G. Wasileski, M.
McDonough, K. Zafft, R. Villaseñor re: same. Draft officer assistance and support assessment report; email
communications w/ M. McDonough, S. Smoot re: same.

09/29/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.80

 Various email communications w/ K. Thompson, S. Rosenthal, G. Wasileski, R. Dupont re: use of force
assessment. Conference call w/ M. McDonough, N. Joyce, C. Ramsey re: community policing assessment
methodology. Conference call w/ M. McDonough, S. Rosenthal, R. Villaseñor, G. Wasileski re: use of force
assessment report.

09/30/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.40

 Draft, edit, revise, and format draft use of force assessment report; email communications w/ G. Wasileski, M.
McDonough, S. Rosenthal, Parties re: same.

Pro Bono Hours 3.40

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.90

 Conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: investigative stop system update.

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.00

 Particiapte in bi-weekly conference call w/ S. Rosenthal, M. McDonough, G. Wasileski K. Zafft re: outcome
assessments.

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 39.30
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09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.50

 Participate in bi-weekly conference call w/ S. Rosenthal, G. Wasileski, M. McDonough re: outcome assessments.

09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.40

 Participate in weekly conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training. Various email communications w/ BPD, MT re:
1A Assessment, instructor selection policy, PRB training, use of force assessment.

09/27/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.60

 Various email communications w/ MT re: use of force assessment report; revise and edit same. Various email
communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training topics.

Total 39.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Page 3 of 3



Expense report for
Invoice Baltimore
Monitor September
2022 Invoice

21CP Solutions, LLC

$174.0009/09/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Squarespace/GSuite BPD Monitor email charges.
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$29.0009/12/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Squarespace BPDMonitor.com website monthly
charges.
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$81.1109/17/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Electronic assessment platform charges. (1/2 of
overall invoice amount).
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$80.0009/24/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Annual website domain renewal fees (4) (via
Squarespace).
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 25.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Wasileski Gabriela

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 25.00

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

1.00

 Axon records Meeting

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

 UOF analysis, officer's injuries data set

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

 UOF regression analysis, MT check in meeting

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

 UOF regression analysis, incidents disposition, corrective actions

09/10/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

 UOF regression analysis, incidents disposition, corrective actions

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

 final UOF analysis, compensation board data

09/27/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

 UOF analysis, IPro data and qualitative data files

Total 25.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 7.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Zafft Katie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

CJI Research Team 7.50

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

1.00

 data review and communication to monitoring team regarding mock data for stop/search/arrest RMS data (459f-
g.iii)

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

2.00

 sexual assault outcome assessment 2020 data analysis and communication to BPD regarding UCR case closures.

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

1.00

 outcome assessment status update with Monitoring Team, use of force methodology

09/14/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

2.00

 arrest assessment review, 1A methods review, UOF sampling methodology draft statement, assessment of 212-
217 paragraphs.

09/23/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

0.50

 call regarding Axon and investigative stops with MT, BPD, and DOJ

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

1.00

 Assemble call for service information for the UOF assessment report draft.

Total 7.50
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 3.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Drake Jessica

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Administrative Costs 2.50

09/22/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.50

 Website updates invoices and reports

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 1.00

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

 CE Standing call, follow-ups emails.

Total 3.50
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 1.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Goodrich Maggie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 1.00

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Goodrich
Maggie

1.00

 Status meeting with Parties re technology

Total 1.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 16.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Joyce Nola

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Joyce Nola 16.80

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.90

 Review and comment on Policy 322

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 4.00

 SOU tour with Judge Bredar

09/11/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 2.20

 Community policing assessment methodology

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.70

 Recruitment and retention meeting

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 2.00

 SA meeting

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.70

 Review of Sexual Assault e-learning

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.40

Total 16.80

Page 1 of 2



$128.8009/09/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Mileage
Person Joyce Nola

Round trip between Rehoboth Beach, DE and
Baltimore [230.0 miles]
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$51.7509/09/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Joyce Nola

Travel day per diem
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$29.0009/09/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Other
Person Joyce Nola

Parking
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 50.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team McDonough Megan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Arrests Assessment 3.40

09/02/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

 Check Alchemer

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.60

 Check in on PC progress

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

 Onboard Sue; assign additional cases

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

 Check on case submission and assign new cases

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

 Assist reviewer; onboard new reviewer

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.30

 Follow up with reviewers

09/22/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

 Follow up with reviewers

Total 50.90
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Associate Consultant Professional Fees 20.90

09/05/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Correspondence re: community survey

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

3.50

discuss community survey next steps

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.60

Assessment correspondence; biweekly assessments meeting

09/10/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

Arrestee Survey Methodology

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Assessment correspondence

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Recruitment Methodology; Misconduct follow up

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.30

Survey memo; correspondence; PC assignments

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

survey meeting prep

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Assessment updates call and email

09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

3.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 50.90
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Community Survey Meeting with Judge

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.40

Community Survey memo

09/22/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Community Survey correspondence

09/23/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.10

Assessment correspondence; crisis methodology; stops and searches data collection call with Axon

09/27/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Follow up on draft methodology

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

5.40

Draft OSW sections

09/28/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.40

Assessment correspondence and methodology

CPOP Assessment 0.40

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Review correspondence from N Joyce\

09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Schedule call with team

First Amendment Protected Activities Assessment 1.80

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

Methodology Tasks

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 50.90
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09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Document requests and MT assignments

09/22/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.50

Discuss Methodology

09/24/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Convert instrument to Alchemer

Misconduct Investigations Assessment 3.20

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.50

Revised PIB assessment

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.40

Circulate interim report to parties

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

Interim Assessment

09/15/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.50

PIB Methodology Revision

Pro Bono Hours 8.70

09/03/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.40

Correspondence re: community surcey

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.50

Community survey corespondence

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 50.90
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Recruitment call

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Arrestee Survey methodology

09/14/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.50

Clarify instrument question

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

3.00

Review draft compliance assessment

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

Review article re: interim memo

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.10

Recruitment and Retention Call; UoF assessment next steps

09/29/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

Preliminary discussion re: Community Policing methodology

09/30/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

Circulate revised crisis methodology

Sexual Assault Investigations Assessment 5.40

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

Follow up re: problem case

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

Check in on progress

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 50.90
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09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.50

Download final data

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

Send Gabriela prior report

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Pull data for call with DOJ

09/22/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.60

Pull data for call with DOJ

09/23/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.50

Sexual Assault Case Review

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.60

Draft report

09/28/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Arrange a new DOJ meeting time, send out poll

09/30/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Schedule meeting with DOJ, provide update on assessment timing

Stop Data for New RMS Assessment 1.20

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.90

Meeting with BPD/Axon, and review of documentation

09/02/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 50.90
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Meeting with BPD/Axon, and review of documentation

Transportation of Persons in Custody Assessment 0.80

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

Monthly Transport Meeting

Use of Force Assessment 5.10

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.20

Review draft compliance assessment

09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.20

Review draft compliance assessment

09/29/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Meeting to discuss report draft

Total 50.90

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$236.6309/19/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Lodging
Person McDonough Megan

One night at Residence Inn, Baltimore (9/19-20)
for meeting with Judge and Parties re:
Community Survey
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$51.7509/19/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person McDonough Megan

Travel Day Per Diem

$228.0009/20/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Amtrak to/from meeting with Judge and Parties
re: Community Survey

$9.9409/20/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber from Baltimore Penn Station to Hotel
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$9.1009/20/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person McDonough Megan

Uber from meeting to Baltimore Penn Station
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$51.7509/20/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person McDonough Megan

Travel Per Diem
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 13.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Ramsey Charles

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Ramsey Charles 13.00

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 2.00

 Review documents in Box

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.50

 Weekly CE Call

09/06/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.50

 Review SIRT Case 22J-036

09/10/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.50

 conference call with Hasan

09/10/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.50

 Conference call with Harrison

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 0.50

 Weekly CE call

09/14/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 1.00

 Conference call with Commissioner Harrison

Total 13.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 4.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Smoot Sean

Date Client Project Task Roles Hours

Smoot Sean 4.30

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 1.00

 Conf call re semi-annual report and compliance audit re OWS

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 1.30

 Emails, Recruiting Retention and OSW conf call w BPD.

09/26/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner
Professional Fees

Partner 2.00

 Budget review and recruiting/retention/OSW virtual meeting.

Total 4.30
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 9.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Sue Rahr

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Arrests Assessment 9.00

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Sue
Rahr

1.00

reviewed materials from Megan and tried to get into BWC files

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Sue
Rahr

1.00

Arrests Assessment

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Sue
Rahr

1.00

Arrests Assessment

09/19/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Sue
Rahr

3.00

Arrests Assessment

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Sue
Rahr

3.00

Arrests Assessment

Total 9.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 9.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Terri Wilfong

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Sexual Assault Investigations Assessment 9.50

09/03/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.50

20S271

09/04/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.50

20S271

09/05/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.50

20S271

09/07/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

3.00

20S241

09/08/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.00

20S241

09/09/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.00

20S271

Total 9.50
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 09/01/2022 – 09/30/2022

Total 60.20 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Villaseñor Roberto

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 41.20

09/01/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.20

Comstat

09/10/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.00

Work on Court Presentation for Sept. 15 Quarterly Hearing

09/11/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Work on Court Presentation for Sept. 15 Quarterly Hearing

09/13/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Conduct Transport Audit Reviews for April - July

09/14/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Attend ROCA training at Academy

09/15/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Prepare for and participate in Monthly Court Hearing - On-site

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Work on UOF Assessment draft

Total 60.20
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09/20/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.20

Work on UOF Semiannual Assessment draft

09/21/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.60

Continue review of UOF Assessment

09/24/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.50

Work on UOF Assessment

09/25/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.20

Work on UOF Assessment

09/29/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.30

Comstat / Discussion on UOF Report

09/30/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.20

Work on Comprehensive Reassessment

Pro Bono Hours 19.00

09/03/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Various emails and reading

09/04/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Various emails and reading

09/12/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Travel to Baltimore

09/16/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 60.20
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Travel home

09/18/2022 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Various emails and reading

Total 60.20

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$51.7509/12/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Travel Per Diem

$69.0009/13/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per Diem

$15.9109/13/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

BPD to Hotel
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$10.9809/13/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Hotel to BPD
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$69.0009/14/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per Diem

$17.9309/14/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Hotel to BPD Academy
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$12.9909/14/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Academy to Hotel
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$9.9509/14/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Hotel to Pre-Court Meeting
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$69.0009/15/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per Diem

$619.3509/16/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Split Flight Cost with Another Client on East
Coast
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$643.9209/16/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Lodging
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Baltimore Hotel
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$31.5709/16/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

1/2 of Parking for Trip
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$35.0009/12/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

BWI to Airport
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$13.7809/16/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Mileage
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Drive From Airport to Home [24.6 miles]

$51.7509/16/2022

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Travel Day
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9/22/22, 10:00 AMYour location to Tucson International Airport - Google Maps

Page 1 of 2https://www.google.com/maps/dir/32.3582191,-111.1350173/Tucson+In…67b1308d0d5b7:0xb3306c2afc112615!2m2!1d-110.9392269!2d32.1145102

Map data ©2022 Google 2 mi 

Drive 24.6 miles, 31 minYour location to Tucson International Airport



9/22/22, 10:00 AMYour location to Tucson International Airport - Google Maps

Page 2 of 2https://www.google.com/maps/dir/32.3582191,-111.1350173/Tucson+I…67b1308d0d5b7:0xb3306c2afc112615!2m2!1d-110.9392269!2d32.1145102

Explore Tucson International Airpo!

31 min

24.6 miles

via I-10 E

Best route now due to tra?c
conditions

31 min

23.4 miles

via I-10 E and S Tucson Blvd

Restaurants Hotels Gas stations Parking Lots More
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