
 

 

 
April 17, 2024 Kenneth L. Thompson 

T 410.244.7575 
F 410.244.7742 
KLThompson@Venable.com 

 
 

Mayor and City Council of Baltimore  
Attn: Ebony Thompson, City Solicitor  
City Hall, Suite 101 
100 Holliday Street 
Baltimore, MD 21202 
 
Police Department of Baltimore City 
Attn: Richard Worley, Policing Commissioner 
Shannon Sullivan, Director 
242 W 29th Street  
Baltimore, MD 21211-2908 
 
Timothy Mygatt  
Nicole Porter 
U.S. Department of Justice  
Civil Rights Division  
Special Litigation Section  
950 Pennsylvania Ave., NW  
Washington, DC 20530 
 

RE: Baltimore Police Monitoring Team – March Invoice 
 

This document, including attachments, is the invoice of the Baltimore Police Monitoring 
Team (“Team”) for services performed and expenses incurred in March 2024. 

Narrative Summary 

This invoice accounts for time worked from March 1 to March 31, 2024, by team 
members Kenneth Thompson, Evan Shea, Hassan Aden, Matthew Barge, Theron Bowman, 
Christine Cole, Gabriela Wasileski, Katie Zafft, Jessica Drake, Randolph Dupont, Emily 
Gunston, Tyeesha Dixon, Joshua Grossman, Nola Joyce, Megan McDonough, Tracey Meares, 
Charles Ramsey, Ravi Shroff, Sean Smoot, Terri Wilfong, Roberto Villasenor, Wanda Watts, 
Antonio Boyd, Debra Johnson, and Mark Hughes. 

 
The sum of previous services and expenses reflected in this invoice to be remitted is 

$128,469.40. 
 
Of the time submitted in this invoice, 25.8 hours, or 6%, were pro bono, or unbilled and 

donated to the City of Baltimore. By recording 6% of its total time pro bono, and writing off 
certain expenses, the Team saved the city a total of $9,279.00. 



 

 

 

Work performed in March 2024 included: 

 
 Community outreach and meetings between Monitoring Team members, including 

neighborhood liaisons, and community stakeholders, and collaborations with BPD 
and DOJ regarding coordinated outreach 

 Virtual and telephonic meetings regarding Consent Decree requirements on 
stops/searches/arrests, community policing, use of force, interactions with 
individuals with behavioral health disabilities, technology and data collection and 
maintenance, interactions with youth, impartial policing, misconduct investigations 
and discipline, training, sexual assault investigations, supervision, staffing, 
recruitment, hiring, transportation individuals in custody, officer assistance and 
support, compliance reviews and outcome assessments 

 Initiating our second comprehensive assessment on use of force 
 Continuing our second comprehensive assessment on training 
 Continuing our comprehensive assessment on interactions with youth 
 Continuing our comprehensive assessment on misconduct investigations and 

discipline 
 Developing methodologies for assessments on stops and searches and sexual 

assault investigations, and use of force 
 Reviewing BPD sustainment plans for transportation of individuals in custody and 

officer assistance and support 
 Reviewing drafts of report on arrests resulting in a release without a charge 
 Reviewing revised policies regarding stops, searches, and arrests 
 Reviewing BPD training and training curricula on stops, searches, and arrests 
 Observing/evaluating Performance Review Board (“PRB”) meetings 
 Addressing issues relating to interactions with individuals with behavioral health 

disabilities, including meetings with Baltimore City Behavioral Health 
Collaborative and evaluating data on crisis response 

 Meetings and communications with Judge Bredar to inform him and receive his 
feedback about the progress of the project 

 Preparing for quarterly public hearing 
 Preparing the Seventh-Year Monitoring Plan 
 Preparing and updating content for the team’s website 
 Engaging with residents on social media 

 
 



 

 

Invoice Summary 

Invoice Totals – March 2024 

 
 

Fiscal Year Totals 

Category Type
Previously Billed 

(FY2024)
Mar 2024 Billed Fiscal YTD Billed

Budget Services $1,102,212.00 $128,045.50 $1,230,257.50
Budget Expenses $21,647.57 $423.90 $22,071.47

Budget Total: $1,123,859.57 $128,469.40 $1,252,328.97
Non-Budget Rental $6,259.50 $0.00 $6,259.50

Non-Budget Total: $6,259.50 $0.00 $6,259.50
Total to be Remitted: $1,130,119.07 $128,469.40 $1,258,588.47

FY2024 Budget $1,581,838.00

Funds Remaining in FY2024 Budget $329,509.03
Percentage of Funds Used in FY2024 Budget 79%
FY2024 YTD Value of Pro Bono Services $174,621.00



 

 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 
March Total Hours Billed Hours Pro Bono 

Hours 
Total Services Billed Total Expenses 

Billed  
Thompson 56.50 43.10 13.40 $20,472.50 $0.00 

Shea 78.60 78.60 0.00 $37,335.00 $0.00 

Aden 30.50 29.90 0.60 $7,026.50 $36.00 

Barge 19.50 19.50 0.00 $4,582.50 $82.50 

Bowman 23.70 23.70 0.00 $5,569.50 $0.00 

Cole 8.50 8.50 0.00 $1,997.50 $0.00 

CJI: Wasileski 30.00 30.00 0.00 $7,050.00 $0.00 

CJI: Zafft 10.80 10.80 0.00 $2,538.00 $0.00 

Drake (CE) 11.80 11.80 0.00 $2,773.00 $0.00 

Dupont 28.80 21.30 7.50 $5,005.50 $0.00 

Gunston 6.60 6.60 0.00 $1,551.00 $0.00 

Goodrich 1.50 1.50 0.00 $352.50 $0.00 

Grossman 10.80 10.80 0.00 $2,538.00 $0.00 

Joyce 16.10 16.10 0.00 $3,783.50 $230.40 

McDonough 30.90 30.40 0.50 $7,144.00 $0.00 

Meares 13.30 13.30 0.00 $3,125.50 $0.00 

Ramsey 25.50 25.50 0.00 $5,992.50 $0.00 

Shroff 1.40 1.40 0.00 $329.00 $0.00 

Smoot 2.30 2.30 0.00 $540.50 $0.00 

Wilfong 3.50 3.50 0.00 $822.50 $0.00 

Villasenor 14.00 10.20 3.80 $2,397.00 $0.00 

Watts 20.10 20.10 0.00 $4,723.50 $0.00 
Boyd  
(Neighborhood 
Liaison) 6.00 6.00 0.00 $120.00 $25.00 
Johnson  
(Neighborhood 
Liaison) 8.00 8.00 0.00 $160.00 $25.00 
Hughes, M. 
(Neighborhood 
Liaison) 5.80 5.80 0.00 $116.00 $25.00 

Total 464.50 438.70 25.80 $128,045.50 $423.90 

 

 

 

 
  



 

 

Individual Invoices and Supporting Documentation 
 

The remainder of this invoice includes the individual invoices of all Team members who 
submitted invoices for March 2024, as well as receipts for travel, transportation, accommodations, and 
expenses incurred for website development, and establishment of Team e-mail addresses. 

 
The City and the Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for meals 

and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Baltimore for work on the project will do so at the 
standard federal per diem rate of $69, with fractions of days billed at 75% of the standard federal per 
diem rate, or $51.75. Some team members have waived or reduced their per diem charges or elected to 
receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to and working in Baltimore. This constitutes 
additional, ongoing savings to the City. 
 

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and the City of Baltimore. As 
previously discussed, we ask both parties to review the invoice and get back to us with any comments or 
suggested changes within five days. Once we obtain approval of the invoice, we will submit it to Judge 
James Bredar for his review and approval. 
 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 

Sincerely, 
 

 
Kenneth Thompson 

 
 
 



750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: March
INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Thompson
DATE SUBMITTED: 4/17/2024
YEAR: 2024

Month of Day Description Hours Rate Total Comments (Unbilled Time)
Unbilled 

Hours
March 1  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 2  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 3  0 475.00$ -$  0.0

March 4

Review parties Submissions and related materials in preparation for 
Thursday’s monthly meeting (1.1); continue to review SSA modules (.7); 
prepare for tomorrow’s meeting with BPD regarding Youth Use of Force 
pilot assessments (.2); review memo from R. Dupont regarding paragraph 
97 issues (.2)

2.2

475.00$ 1,045.00$ 
Work on logistics for the March monthly meeting and the April Public 
hearing; prepare for tomorrow’s Community Engagement Committee 
meeting (1)

1.0

March 5
Prepare for and attend Community Engagement Team meeting (.3); re-
review DOJ’s Submission (.2)

0.5
475.00$ 237.50$  0.0

March 6
Review Monitoring Team submissions (.5); review materials in connection 
with youth arrests in preparation for upcoming assessment (.7)

1.2
475.00$ 570.00$ 

Work on final logistics for tomorrow’s monthly meeting; work on 
community engagement issues (.7)

0.7

March 7
Prepare for and attend monthly meeting (4.2); begin reviewing draft 
Misconduct and Discipline Comprehensive Assessment (.7)

4.9
475.00$ 2,327.50$ 

Work on logistics for the upcoming Community forum in April; work on 
administrative issues (1.2)

1.2

March 8
Continue to review the Comprehensive PIB Assessment Report draft (1.2); 
review BPD’s Sexual Assault Data Report (1)

2.2
475.00$ 1,045.00$ Work on logistics for the April Public Hearing and Public Forum (1.1) 1.1

March 9  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 10  0 475.00$ -$  0.0

March 11
Review SSA Training modules (.7); continue review of the PIB assessment 
and discuss same with E. Shea (.6)

1.3
475.00$ 617.50$ Work on administrative issues including (1.2) 1.2

March 12
Attend portion of the SSA training (1.6); review draft Monitoring Plan (1.2) 2.8

475.00$ 1,330.00$  0.0

March 13
Review notes from CIT assessments in preparation for meeting with G. 
Wasiliski and R. Dupont (.6); re-review sections of the draft 7th year 
Monitoring Plan (.7)

1.3
475.00$ 617.50$ 

Work on community engagement schedule;  work on logistics for the 
upcoming Public Hearing (1.4)

1.4

March 14

Continue to review the SSA training modules (1.2); begin working on 
presentation for the upcoming Public Hearing (1); continue to review 
sections of the draft 7th Year Monitoring Plan (.4)

2.6

475.00$ 1,235.00$ Work on administrative issues (.6) 0.6

March 15

Prepare for and attend CIT assessment meeting with G. Wasiliski and R. 
Dupont, including policy review after the meeting (1.6); review Data 
Informed sub-committee notes and related materials (.2)

1.8

475.00$ 855.00$ 
Work on administrative issues; continue working on community 
engagement plan (.4)

0.4

March 16  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 17  0 475.00$ -$  0.0

March 18

Review CAD CIT cases and provide G. Wasileski with cases for discussion 
with the parties (.3); continue to review the draft Monitoring Plan and 
discuss same with E. shea (.6); review materials in preparation for 
upcoming Public hearing (1.3)

2.2

475.00$ 1,045.00$ Work on administrative issues (.6) 0.6

March 19

Continue to review draft Monitoring Plan with specific reference to 
addressing Paragraph 97 issues (.6); continue to review draft PIB 
Assessment (.8); review January BCBHC meeting notes (.2); continue 
working on presentation for the Public Hearing (.8)

2.4

475.00$ 1,140.00$ 
Work on logistics for the Public Forum and Hearing; work on 
administrative issues (1.2)

1.2

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

TIME



March 20
Telephone conference with R. Dupont re: Paragraph 97 issues (.2); begin 
working on next batch of CAD CIT cases (.4); continue reviewing sections of 
PIB assessment (.5)

1.1
475.00$ 522.50$ 

Work on administrative issues; re-evaluate community engagement 
plan (.6)

0.6

March 21

Meet with G. Wasileski regarding discussion of CAD CIT issues (.8); continue 
preparing for the April Public forum and Hearing (1.2); review Data 
Subcommittee notes (.2); re-review Youth Arrest survey instrument (.2); 
continue analyzing sections of the Monitoring Plan (.4)

2.8

475.00$ 1,330.00$ 
Work on administrative issues; review Amended Scheduling Order in 
connection with the draft Monitoring Plan (.7)

0.7

March 22  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 23  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 24  0 475.00$ -$  0.0

March 25
Work on CAD CIT assessments (1.7); review and evaluate DOJ’s proposed 
edits to the 7th Year Monitoring Plan (.6); review sections of the PIB 
assessment (.7)

3
475.00$ 1,425.00$ 

Work on logistics for next weeks Forum and Public Hearing; work on 
administrative issues (.6)

0.6

March 26

Conference with the Court regarding the upcoming Public Hearing (.3); 
continue reviewing materials in preparation for the Public hearing (2.2); 
review BPD’s edits to the draft Monitoring Plan and discuss (.4); work on 
CAD CIT assessments (.6)

3.5

475.00$ 1,662.50$ 
Communicate with the Monitoring Team regarding the Public Forum 
and Hearing; evaluate next steps regarding the Community Survey; 
work on administrative issues (1.3)

1.3

March 27

Continue to review the Monitoring Plan with specific reference to 
paragraph 97 issues and participate in telephone conference with R. 
Dupont regarding same (.7); telephone conference with D. Cooper 
regarding next week’s Public Hearing (.2);  review materials in connection 
with working on Use Of Force assessments (.4); review revised Monitoring 
Plan (.7); telephone conference with L. Ameli-Grillon regarding Public 
Hearing issues (.2); continue to review the draft PIB assessment (.6)

2.8

475.00$ 1,330.00$ 
Work on community engagement schedule; review community liaison 
materials for possible revisions (.4)

0.4

March 28
Prepare for and attend Northeast Commanders Community meeting (2.2); 
work on CAD CIT assessments (1.1); review materials in preparation for 
next week’s Public Hearing (1.2)

4.5
475.00$ 2,137.50$ Review community response to paragraph 97 issues (.4) 0.4

March 29  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 30  0 475.00$ -$  0.0
March 31  0 475.00$ -$  0.0

Total 43.1  $475.00 $ 20,472.50 13.4

Date Category Travel Day Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per daily 
Guidelines cap of $71 

per day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal Expense Total

 $-    $-   
 $-    $-   
 $-    $-   
 $-    $-   

TOTAL:  $           -   

Subtotal Time: 43.10
Subtotal Expenses:  $-   
TOTAL:  $20,472.50 
Unbilled Hours 13.4

KLT
INITIALS

Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are accurate:                                                                                                                                                         KLT

EXPENSES
MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log March 1 - 31, 2023

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: March

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Shea
DATE SUBMITTED: 4/17/2024

YEAR: 2024

TIME 

Month of Day Hours  Rate Total
Unbilled 

Hours
March 1 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 

March 2 1.5 475.00$              712.50$  
March 3 2.3 475.00$              1,092.50$                 

March 4 6 475.00$              2,850.00$                 
March 5 2 475.00$              950.00$  

March 6 475.00$              -$  

March 7 5.5 475.00$              2,612.50$                 

March 8 1 475.00$              475.00$  

March 9 475.00$              -$  

March 10 475.00$              -$  
March 11 3.5 475.00$              1,662.50$                 

March 12 7.5 475.00$              3,562.50$                 
March 13 475.00$              -$  
March 14 1 475.00$              475.00$  

March 15 475.00$              -$  
March 16 475.00$              -$  
March 17 475.00$              -$  
March 18 3.1 475.00$              1,472.50$                 

March 19 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 
March 20 5.7 475.00$              2,707.50$                 
March 21 2.5 475.00$              1,187.50$                 
March 22 4.5 475.00$              2,137.50$                 
March 23 475.00$              -$  
March 24 475.00$              -$  
March 25 6.5 475.00$              3,087.50$                 
March 26 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 

March 27 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Draft monitoring plan; call with R. Dupont re same (6.5)

Attend monthly meeting; prepare for same (4.5); conference with R. Dupont re monitoring plan (1)

Revise PIB assessment report (4.0)

Revise training assessment (1.0); calls with K. Thompson, R. Villasenor, and N. Joyce re monitoring 
plan and revise same (1.0) debrief re SSA training (0.5); draft budget letter (0.6)

Draft monitoring plan (1.0)

Revise Training Assessment Report (1); Community engagement call (1)

Revise PIB assessment report (1.0); review policy on deaf persons (0.5)
Revise PIB assessment report (2.3)

Revise Training Assessment Report (2.5); Draft Monitoring Plan (3.5)

Observe SSA training (7.0) revise monitoring plan (0.5)

Description 

Conference re PIB assessment (0.5) call with H. Aden re monitoring plan (0.5)

Conference with R. Dupont re monitoring plan (1.0); review statement to press with K. Thompson and 
call re same (0.5); review PIB assessment (1); monthly SSA data call (0.5); draft budget letter (0.5)

Review monitoring plan, calls with K. Thompson re same (4.0)

Draft first amendment assessment (2.5); call re SSA policies (1.0); call re case status (0.5)

Revise training assessment (4)
Revise training assessment (5.7)
Revise training assessment (1.5); call re SSA assessment (1.0)
Revise training assessment (4.5)



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log March 1 - 31, 2023

March 28 3.5 475.00$              1,662.50$                 

March 29 5.5 475.00$              2,612.50$                 

March 30 1 475.00$              475.00$  

March 31 475.00$              -$  
78.6 475.00$              37,335.00$              0

Revise monitoring plan (1.5); draft memorandum submission of monitoring plan (1.5) call with DOJ re 
monitoring plan (0.5)

Draft monitoring plan, call with S. Rosenthal re same (3.5) use of force case review (2.0)

Use of force case reviews for assessment (1.0)



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log March 1 - 31, 2023

EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

-$  

Yes -$  -$  

-$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log March 1 - 31, 2023

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  

No -$  -$  
TOTAL: -$  

Subtotal Time: 37,335.00$  
Subtotal Expenses: -$  

TOTAL: 37,335.00$  
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: ETS



4/17/2024 / 8:20 AM Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
INVOICE

Page 1

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-re
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: March

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Bowman
DATE SUBMITTED: 4/13/2024

YEAR: 2024

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate Total Unbilled 

Hours
March 1 Review and respond to messages - Use of Force, Specialized Units, and 

Community Policing  
0.1 235.00$              23.50$             

March 2 235.00$              -$                  
March 3 235.00$              -$                  
March 4 Review and respond to messages - Policy 1006 ShotSpotter Gunshot 

Detection Service, SSA Pilots, Axon Records SSA Monthly Data Meeting,  
IMPORTANT DATES: 2024 Monitoring Team Scheduling Order,   

0.7 235.00$              164.50$           

March 5 Meeting - SSA Training observation via Teams  8 235.00$              1,880.00$        
March 6 Review and respond to messages - Q3 2023 RWOC Report, SSA Pilot 

Feedback, SSA Pilot Training Debriefing Scheduling, Teams  
2.2 235.00$              517.00$           

March 7 235.00$              -$                  
March 8  Review and respond to messages - SSA Pilot Feedback, SSA Policies, 

Second Revisions- Uploaded to Box,   
0.8 235.00$              188.00$           

March 9 235.00$              -$                  
March 10 235.00$              -$                  

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the 
d h2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample 

Description" below3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a 
day, which you inevitably will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, 
itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service 
training; meet with Ms. Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed 
UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

Description 
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Comments (Unbilled Time)



4/17/2024 / 8:20 AM Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
INVOICE

Page 2

March 11 Meeting - Axon Records SSA Monthly Data Meeting, SSA collaboration. 
Review and respond to messages - SSA Policies, Second Revisions- 
Uploaded to Box, Traffic violations/BPD, Axon Records SSA Monthly Data 
Meeting.  

1.3 235.00$              305.50$           

March 12 Review and respond to messages - Axon Records SSA Monthly Data 
Meeting, SSA Policies, Second Revisions- Uploaded to Box, WYPR news 
request-- talk about BPD traffic enforcement  

1.3 235.00$              305.50$           

March 13 235.00$              -$                  
March 14 Review and respond to messages - SSA Methodology Internal Discussion  0.9 235.00$              211.50$           

March 15 Review and respond to messages - SSA Methodology Internal Discussion, 0.5 235.00$              117.50$           

March 16 235.00$              -$                  
March 17 235.00$              -$                  
March 18 Meeting - SSA Pilot Training Debriefing Scheduling 0.3 235.00$              70.50$             
March 19 Meeting - SSA policy review -prepare and participate in meeting  1.7 235.00$              399.50$           
March 20 Review and respond to messages - Q3 2023 RWOC Report, SSA Policy 

Review, SSA Policies, Second Revisions- Uploaded to Box
1.2 235.00$              282.00$           

March 21 Meeting - BPD SSA Methodology internal discussion  0.9 235.00$              211.50$           
March 22 Review and respond to messages - SSA Policies, Second Revisions- 

Uploaded to Box, Axon Records SSA Monthly Data Meeting, Policy 1006 
ShotSpotter Gunshot Detection Service  

0.6 235.00$              141.00$           

March 23 235.00$              -$                  
March 24 235.00$              -$                  
March 25 235.00$              -$                  
March 26 Meeting - SSA policy review -prepare and participate in meeting . 

03/26/2024 - Baltimore PD Consent Decree. Review and respond to 
messages - SSA Policies, Second Revisions- Uploaded to Box, BPD Use of 
Force Review--Pilot Case Review DUE JANUARY 5.

2.1 235.00$              493.50$           

March 27 Review and respond to messages - SSA Assessment Methodology for 
Review, BPD Use of Force Assessment--Batch 1 Case Assignment--DUE 
APRIL 15  

0.2 235.00$              47.00$             

March 28 235.00$              -$                  
March 29 Review and respond to messages - BPD Use of Force Assessment--Batch 

1 Case Assignment--DUE APRIL 15, SSA Policies, Second Revisions- 
Uploaded to Box, SSA Assessment Methodology for Review  

0.9 235.00$              211.50$           

March 30 235.00$              -$                  
March 31 235.00$              -$                  

23.7 TOTAL: 5,569.50$        0



4/17/2024 / 8:20 AM Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
INVOICE

Page 3

EXPENSES

Date Category Comments (if necessary) Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $69 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense Total

Transportation Yes -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

Yes -$                    -$                          

Yes -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



4/17/2024 / 8:20 AM Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
INVOICE

Page 4

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          



4/17/2024 / 8:20 AM Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor
INVOICE

Page 5

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          

No -$                    -$                          
TOTAL: -$                          

Subtotal Time: 5,569.50$             
Subtotal Expenses: -$                       

TOTAL: 5,569.50$             
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: TLB



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900

Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: March

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Dupont
DATE SUBMITTED: 4/4/2024

YEAR: 2024

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day  Rate Total

Unbilled 
Hours

March 1 235.00$              -$                           

March 2 235.00$              -$                           

March 3 235.00$              -$                           

March 4 1.8 235.00$              423.00$                    

March 5 235.00$              -$                           

March 6 1.3 235.00$              305.50$                    0.7

March 7 1 235.00$              235.00$                    0.3

March 8 1.2 235.00$              282.00$                    0.3

March 9 235.00$              -$                           

March 10 235.00$              -$                           

March 11 0.9 235.00$              211.50$                    

March 12 1 235.00$              235.00$                    

Description 

Discussion of Crisis Intervention Progress with advocates and interested individuals

Co
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Discussion of Monitoring Plan with Monitoring Team member E shea

Development of Court Documents, Discussion of Crisis intervention progress with parties

Disccussion of Monitoring Plan with Parties

Revew of CDP Body Work Camera video (BWC) from CAD2 sample

Discussion of Monitoring Plan with Monitoring Team member E Shea

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G Wasileski

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member Monitor K 
Thompson

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G Wasileski



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

March 13 235.00$              -$                           

March 14 235.00$              -$                           1.3

March 15 4 235.00$              940.00$                    

March 16 235.00$              -$                           

March 17 235.00$              -$                           

March 18 2.1 235.00$              493.50$                    0.1

March 19 235.00$              -$                           

March 20 1.8 235.00$              423.00$                    0.8

March 21 1.2 235.00$              282.00$                    

March 22 235.00$              -$                           0.2

March 23 235.00$              -$                           

March 24 235.00$              -$                           

March 25 2.7 235.00$              634.50$                    

March 26 0.7 235.00$              164.50$                    0.9

March 27 0.6 235.00$              141.00$                    2.1

March 28 0.8 235.00$              188.00$                    0.5

March 29 0.2 235.00$              47.00$                      0.3

March 30 235.00$              -$                           

March 31 235.00$              -$                           

21.30 235.00$              5,005.50$                 7.5

Meeting with Consent Decree Partires on assessment of CAD2 sample

Discussion of Consent Decree progress with state advocate

Baltimore City Behavioral Health Coalition meeting

Revew of CDP Body Work Camera video (BWC) from CAD2 sample

Revew of CDP Body Work Camera video (BWC) from CAD2 sample

Discussion of Monitoring Plan with Monitoring Team member E Shea, work on Monitoring Team Plan

Discussion of Consent Decree progress with local advocate

Revew of CDP Body Work Camera video (BWC) from CAD2 sample, discussion of CAD2 results with 
Monitoring Team member G Wasileski and Monitor K Thompson,discusison of CAD2 results with 

i

Revew of CDP Body Work Camera video (BWC) from CAD2 sample

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G Wasileski and 
Monitor K Thompson

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G. Wasileski

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G. Wasileski and 
discussion of upcoming court hearing with Monitor K Thompson

Discussion of Community Forum with Monitoring Team Member W Watts

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitoring Team Member G Wasileski and 
Monitor K Thompson

Discussion of BPD BWC with MT Member G. Wasileski

Discussion of CAD2 sample with Monitor K Thompson

Discusison of upcoming court hearing with Monitor K Thompson



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

EXPENSES

Date Category Vendor Comment Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense Total

1/24/2024 Yes  mileage -$                               

1/24/2024 Yes -$                     airfare -$                               

1/24/2024 Yes -$                     taxi -$                               

1/24/2024 Yes 51.75$                 per diem 

1/25/2024 No 69.00$                 per diem 

1/26/2024 Yes -$                     hotel 

1/26/2024 Yes 51.75$                 per diem 

1/26/2024 Yes -$                     taxi -$                               

1/26/2024 Yes  mileage -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               

No -$                    -$                               
TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 5,005.50$                         
Subtotal Expenses: -$                                  Vendor #992110

TOTAL: 5,005.50$                         
Unbilled Hours 7.50 Invoice #105-078

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: RTD



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service Antonio Boyd - 03/07/2024 - Community Engagement / Antonio
Boyd: Attended the Belair-Edison nightly association meeting and
distributed Consent Decree information and presented to about 60
residents the importance of the Consent Decree.

2.00 $20.00 $40.00

Service Antonio Boyd - 03/23/2024 -NL Monthly Meeting (Google Meet) 1.00 $20.00 $20.00

Service Antonio Boyd - 03/28/2024 - Community Engagement / Antonio
Boyd: Reading the 217 page Consent Decree document.

3.00 $20.00 $60.00

Service March Car Allowence 1.00 $25.00 $25.00

Amount Due $145.00

Notes

Prepared by Wanda Watts 
4/2/2024

From Antonio Boyd
1203 N. Ellwood Ave
Baltimore, Md 21213

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Neighborhood
Liaisons

Invoice ID Antonio Boyd

Issue Date 04/02/2024

Due Date 05/02/2024 (Net 30)

Subject March 2024 Invoice

Page 1 of 1



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service Wattsline - 03/05/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts 3.00 $235.00 $705.00

Service Wattsline - 03/06/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Coaching ED NL on how to connect to associations and updating
excel with Community Associations they should connect with in
their districts.

3.00 $235.00 $705.00

Service Wattsline - 03/07/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Meeting with States Attorney office and City Agencies about
Solutions Pac scheduled for May 22, 2024 at Coppin State
University

0.70 $235.00 $164.50

Service Wattsline - 03/12/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Zoom meeting with Debra Johnson and Lauraville Comm Assoc

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service Wattsline - 03/13/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Coaching Antonio Boyd

0.50 $235.00 $117.50

Service Wattsline - 03/13/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Coaching and review of associations and how to employ the
google grid and prep for meeting with 5th District Councilman Yitzy

0.50 $235.00 $117.50

Service Wattsline - 03/13/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Zoom Northern District Commanders Meeting to schedule
presentation

1.30 $235.00 $305.50

Service Wattsline - 03/19/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Frankford Comm Assoc with Debra Johnson

1.80 $235.00 $423.00

Service Wattsline - 03/20/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Southwest Commanders Meeting via Zoom

1.50 $235.00 $352.50

Service Wattsline - 03/23/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
NL Monthly meeting via Google Meet with Debra Johnson, Antonio
Boyd, Mark Hughes, Lamontre Randall

1.50 $235.00 $352.50

From Wanda Watts
1402 N Decker Ave
Baltimore, Md 21213

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Neighborhood
Liaisons

Invoice ID The Wattsline MARCH 2024

Issue Date 04/02/2024

Due Date 05/02/2024 (Net 30)

Subject MARCH 2024 INVOICE

Page 1 of 2



Service Wattsline - 03/25/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Health Neighborhoods, Integrate Mail Chimp and Linked in,
updated contact lists, created FB Event and shared over all
existing CD pages

2.00 $235.00 $470.00

Service Wattsline - 03/27/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Drug Free Coalition

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service Wattsline - 03/27/2024 - Community Engagement / Wanda Watts:
Southeastern District - new NCO, gang unit and Community
Policing Specialists, Youth Explorers, 22 scheduled comm
meetings, Prayer Walk, favorable 311 outcomes

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service Wattsline -03/28/2024 - Northeast District Commanders Meeting
with Ken Thompson and Debra Johnson

1.30 $235.00 $305.50

Amount Due $4,723.50

Page 2 of 2



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service Mark Hughes - 03/09/2024 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Mark
Hughes: Weinberg Place Tenants Meeting

1.00 $20.00 $20.00

Service Mark Hughes - 03/14/2024 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Mark
Hughes: Northwestern District Commander's Meeting

1.00 $20.00 $20.00

Service Mark Hughes - 03/18/2024 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Mark
Hughes: Meeting with Councilman Schliefer

0.50 $20.00 $10.00

Service Mark Hughes - 03/23/2024 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Mark
Hughes: NL Monthly Meeting

1.30 $20.00 $26.00

Service Mark Hughes - 03/25/2024 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Mark
Hughes: 1. Consent Decree Review/Presentation Prep 15 mins. 2.
Windsor Hills Neighbors Meeting 105 mins.

2.00 $20.00 $40.00

Product Mark Hughes - 03/25/2024 - Transportation / Mark Hughes
MARCH CAR ALLOWANCE

1.00 $25.00 $25.00

Amount Due $141.00

Notes

PREPARED BY WANDA WATTS 
4/2/2024

From mARK hUGHES
2817 Oakford Avenue
Baltimoe, Md 21215

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Neighborhood
Liaisons

Invoice ID

Issue Date

Due Date

Subject

Mark Hughes

04/02/2024

MARK HUGHES MARCH 2024 iNVOICE

Page 1 of 1

MARK HUGHES MARCH INVOICE



DDebraa Johnson
57033 Newholmee Ave
Baltimore,, Mdd 21206







(844) 767-2127 (844) SOS-21CP

Date Hours

Mar-24

232.1

4.9

237.0

$54,543.50

Date Amount

Mar-24 $348.90

$348.90

Mar-24 $54,543.50

Mar-24 $348.90

$54,892.40

21CP SOLUTIONS, LLC

332 S Michigan Ave

Suite 1032 - T615

Chicago, Illinois 60604-4434

United States of America vs. Police Department of Baltimore City
Consent Decree: Monitoring Team

Activity

This document, and its attachments, represent the invoice of the 

Baltimore Police Department Monitoring Team (21CP billing) for 

services rendered while monitoring implementation of the Settlement 

Agreement in U.S. v. City of Baltimore Police Department.

Total Billed Hours

Rate: $235/hour or $37.50/hour

FROM: Sean M. Smoot

DATE: April 10, 2024

BILLABLE HOURS

Total Pro Bono Hours

Total Hours Worked

TOTAL DUE FOR REIMBURSEMENT

TOTAL DUE FOR HOURS BILLED

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

Expense

The Court and Monitoring Team have agreed that Team members 

who elect to be compensated for meals and personal expenses 

incurred while traveling to Baltimore for work on the project will do 

so on the standard, federal scale of $69 per day, with fractions of 

75% on Travel days. Some Team members have waived their per 

diem charges, or elected to receive them only for some but not all 

days while traveling to Baltimore.

TOTAL INVOICE FOR MARCH 2024

Total Amount for Hours 

Billed

Total Amount for 

Reimbursement

TOTAL



(844) 767-2127 (844) SOS-21CP

Name
Total 

Hours

Billed 

Hours

Pro Bono 

Hours
Total Billed

Expenses 

Billed
TOTAL

Aden
30.5 29.9 0.6 $7,026.50 $36.00 $7,062.50

Barge
19.5 19.5 0.0 $4,582.50 $82.50 $4,665.00

Cole
8.5 8.5 0.0 $1,997.50 $0.00 $1,997.50

CJI 
40.8 40.8 0.0 $9,588.00 $0.00 $9,588.00

Drake - CE
11.8 11.8 0.0 $2,773.00 $0.00 $2,773.00

Goodrich
1.5 1.5 0.0 $352.50 $0.00 $352.50

Joahua 

Grossman 10.8 10.8 0.0 $2,538.00 $0.00 $2,538.00

Emily Gunston
6.6 6.6 0.0 $1,551.00 $0.00 $1,551.00

Nola
16.1 16.1 0.0 $3,783.50 $230.40 $4,013.90

McDonough
30.9 30.4 0.5 $7,144.00 $0.00 $7,144.00

Meares
13.3 13.3 0.0 $3,125.50 $0.00 $3,125.50

Ramsey
25.5 25.5 0.0 $5,992.50 $0.00 $5,992.50

Ravi Shroff
1.4 1.4 0.0 $329.00 $0.00 $329.00

Smoot
2.3 2.3 0.0 $540.50 $0.00 $540.50

Terri Wilfong
3.5 3.5 0.0 $822.50 $0.00 $822.50

Villaseñor
14.0 10.2 3.8 $2,397.00 $0.00 $2,397.00

Total
237.0 232.1 4.9 $54,543.50 $348.90 $54,892.40

Fiscal Year to Date July 2023 – June 2024

21CP SOLUTIONS, LLC

332 S Michigan Ave

Suite 1032 - T615

Chicago, Illinois 60604-4434

United States of America vs. Police Department of Baltimore City
Consent Decree: Monitoring Team



YTD 2023 $580,785.75

YTD 2023 $16,183.35

YTD 2023 183.7

YTD 2023 $43,169.50

$596,969.10TOTAL (Not including pro bono 

savings)

Total Pro Bono Hours

Total Pro Bono Savings

Total Amount for Hours Billed

Total Amount for Reimbursement



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Aden Hassan (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

29.90 $235.00 $7,026.50

Product BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Expenses for Aden Hassan
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

1.00 $36.00 $36.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Barge Matthew (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

19.50 $235.00 $4,582.50

Product BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Expenses for Barge Matthew
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

1.00 $82.50 $82.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Christine Cole (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

8.50 $235.00 $1,997.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: CJI - Wasileski Gabriela
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

30.00 $235.00 $7,050.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: CJI - Zafft Katie (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

10.80 $235.00 $2,538.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Drake Jessica (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

11.80 $235.00 $2,773.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Emily Gunston (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

6.60 $235.00 $1,551.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Goodrich Maggie (03/01/2024
- 03/31/2024)

1.50 $235.00 $352.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Joshua Grossman
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

10.80 $235.00 $2,538.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Joyce Nola (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

16.10 $235.00 $3,783.50

From 21CP Solutions, LLC
332 S Michigan Ave. 
Suite 1032 – T615 
Chicago, IL 60604-4434 
(844) 767-2127

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Monitoring Team
Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor 
750 E. Pratt, Suite 900 
Baltimore, MD 21202

Invoice ID Baltimore Monitor March 2024 Invoice

Issue Date 04/08/2024

Due Date 05/08/2024 (Net 30)

Page 1 of 2



Product BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Expenses for Joyce Nola
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

1.00 $230.40 $230.40

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: McDonough Megan
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

30.40 $235.00 $7,144.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Meares Tracey (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

13.30 $235.00 $3,125.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Ramsey Charles (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

25.50 $235.00 $5,992.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Ravi Shroff (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

1.40 $235.00 $329.00

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Smoot Sean (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

2.30 $235.00 $540.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Terri Wilfong (03/01/2024 -
03/31/2024)

3.50 $235.00 $822.50

Service BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget: Villaseñor Roberto
(03/01/2024 - 03/31/2024)

10.20 $235.00 $2,397.00

Amount Due $54,892.40

Page 2 of 2



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 29.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Aden Hassan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 14.20

03/04/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.20

 Call and preparation for PIB call with the parties. email and correspondence. Reviewed the DOJ and BPD Court
submissions.

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.40

 Prepared notes for Misconduct and Discipline Court hearing. Email and correspondence.

03/07/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

5.30

 Court re Misconduct and Discipline (including preparation and review). Email and correspondence.

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.50

 Review of draft 7th Year Monitoring Plan sent to the parties. Email and correspondence.

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.50

 Email and correspondence. Review of recent articles the officer misconduct.

03/19/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.40

 Email and correspondence.

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.40

 CD related email and correspondence.

Total 29.90
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03/22/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Review of the City and the DOJ's feedback on the 7th Year MT plan. Email and correspondence.

03/25/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.90

 Received, reviewed and forwarded a citizen complaint on a BPD member. Email and correspondence on CD
related matters.

03/29/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Review of the updated 2024 Monitoring Plan. Review and preparation for upcoming in-person community meeting.

Misconduct Investigations Assessment 5.90

03/03/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.20

 Review of final draft of the Misconduct Assessment, email, feedback and correspondence re Misconduct
Assessment.

03/08/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.30

 Call with Outcome Assessment Team re Misconduct and Discipline Assessment report draft. Call with E. Shea re
2024 Monitoring Plan (various activities and deadlines). Email and correspondence.

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.20

 Reviewed amended assessment report just prior to sending it to the parties. email and correspondence.

03/30/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.20

 Review of BPD's comments/edits/questions re the Misconduct Assessment draft report. Email and
correspondence.

Use of Force Assessment 9.80

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.70

 Checked all connections, passwords and access to remote access points(City Network, remote desktop, IAPro
and Axon), for upcoming UF Assessment. Email and correspondence with UF Assessment workgroup.

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Review of relevant policies for the 2024 UF Assessment #2: 719, 1118, 1111, 412, 409, 725 and 710.

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 29.90
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03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

3.00

 UF Assessment Case Number: NIC 22-0454 and NIC 22-0517. Email and correspondence re "BWC 'archive" issue
on cases to be reviewed.

03/29/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

4.30

 UF Assessment Case Reviews: 22-0517 (finished reviewing archived video), NIC 23-0138, and NIC 22-0738.

Total 29.90

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Expense report for
Invoice Baltimore
Monitor March 2024
Invoice

21CP Solutions, LLC

$36.0003/07/2024

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget
Category Transportation
Person Aden Hassan

Parking for Court on March 7, 2024
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 19.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Barge Matthew

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 19.50

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.00

 Conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: UOF assessment methodology; debrief w/ MT re: same; email
communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: same.

03/04/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.30

 Revise and edit misconduct assessment report; various email communications w/ E. Shea, E. Gunston, H. Aden re:
same. Email communications w/ DOJ re: First Amendment assessment instrument; create copy re: same for DOJ
assessment use.

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.40

 Participate in monthly conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training. Various email communications w/ DOJ, MT re:
First Amendment assessment, use of force assessment, SSA training. Review, edit draft monitoring plan; email
communication w/ E. Shea re: same. Participate in weekly conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.50

 Continue revising and editing misconduct assessment report.

03/08/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

6.70

 Observe SSA pilot training; various email communciations w/ D. Cooper re: same; debrief w/ D. Cooper, D. Potter,
E. Keller, J. Rosenblatt re: same. Conference call w/ E. Shea, H. Aden, E. Gunston re: misconduct assessment
report.

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.50

 Continue revising and editing misconduct assessment report; email communications w/ E. Shea, E. Gunston, H.
Aden re: same, SSA data.

Total 19.50
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03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.60

 Various email communications w/ E. Shea re: outcome assessment status, w/ MT re: SSA policies. Participate in
weekly conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

03/13/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.10

 Conference call w/ R. Villaseñor re: youth assessment.

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.70

 Draft and edit SSA assessment methodology; conduct data analysis re: same; various email communication w/ MT
re: same.

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.70

 Various email communciations w/ G. Wasileski re: UOF data; w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training, monitoring plan.
Conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: SSA training. Revise and update use of force methodology; email
communciations w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: same.

03/19/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.40

 Various email communications w/ MT re: outcome assessment project management, sexual assault investigation
methodology. Participate in weekly conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

03/20/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.20

 Participate in monthly community engagement conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT.

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.20

 Various email communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: SSA data; draft sampling/data analysis re: same. Conference
call w/ MT re: SSA sampling, assessment methodology.

03/25/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.10

 Various email communications w/ MT re: draft monitoring plan.

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.70

 Various email communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: outcome assessment project management, SSA assessment
methodology, UOF assessment methodology. Participate in conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.80

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 19.50
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 Draft and revise SSA assessment methodology; email communications w/ MT re: same. Finalize UOF sampling;
create assessment assignments/schedule; email communications w/ MT re: same.

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.60

 Participate in quarterly BPD IT update call. Various email communications w/ BPD, MT re: UOF assessment, SSA
assessment.

Total 19.50

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$82.5003/17/2024

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget
Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Electronic assessment platform charges. (1/2 of
overall invoice amount). (Although the Billing
Contact is Sean Smoot/Jason Drake, the
charged card remains that of Mr. Barge because
of administrative issues.)
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 8.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Christine Cole

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Recruitment Assessment 4.20

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.30

 prepare note to F. Camera regarding agenda for recruitment meeting based on the outstanding items for
compliance

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.50

 Join MT Assessment Team. Follow up email to BPD for access to Box for GW.

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.10

 Join OSW/Recruitment call with BPD, MT and DOJ

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.30

 join MT Assessment Team call

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.50

 meeting with BPD Recruitment colleagues to discuss paragraphs remaining that are not deemed in initial
compliance

03/19/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.30

 Join MT Assessment Team call

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.00

 meeting with BPD Compliance and Recruitment staff and City HR to discuss ¶421e

Total 8.50
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03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.20

 Follow up call with Freddy to set next steps and discuss strategy around ¶421e

Training Assessment 4.30

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.50

 call with G. Wasileski on the training assessment and data prepare written updates on assessment status

03/23/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.60

 Review Training Assessment after legal review

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.30

 Join MT Assessment Team call

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.10

 scheduling follow on conversation on the Training Assessment edits with MB and ES

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.80

 continued work on the edits in the 2024 training assessment

Total 8.50

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 30.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Wasileski Gabriela

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 30.00

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

 Youth case review administration, data cleaning

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

 training OA data analysis, CIT data cleaning

03/20/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

4.00

 CIT CAD case reviews

03/22/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

4.00

 CIT CAD cases reviews, Youth OA UoF data analysis for para 459

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

4.00

 Youth OA report writing and UoF data analysis

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

4.00

 YOuth Para 218 data analysis - UoF and Field Interviews

03/29/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

3.00

 YOuth Para 218 data analysis - UoF and Field Interviews

Total 30.00
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03/30/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

 Youth OA report drafting

03/31/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

 Youth OA report drafting

Total 30.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 10.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Zafft Katie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Sexual Assault Investigations Assessment 10.80

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

5.00

 sexual assault methodology draft

03/04/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

0.80

 MT/BPD/DOJ call re sexual assault investigations progress towards compliance.

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

2.50

 sexual assault outcome and compliance assessment draft and investigations training case study review.

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

0.50

 MT call re: outcome assessments and report out on progress on sexual assault assessment draft review.

03/15/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

2.00

 Draft revisions to sexual assault assessment methodology based on party feedback.

Total 10.80
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 11.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Drake Jessica

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 7.80

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.50

 Community Engagement Meeting with the Parties, prep for and follow up call with W. Watts

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.30

 Observing NCO Training

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

 Feedback on Draft Community Policing PCM

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

3.00

 Observing NCO Training

Youth Assessment 4.00

03/13/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

 Officer focus group prep and notes follow up

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

 Focus group with Officers prep and follow up

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.00

Total 11.80
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 Focus groups with Sergeants and another one with Lieutenants

Total 11.80

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 1.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Goodrich Maggie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 1.50

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Goodrich
Maggie

1.00

 EIS planning meeting

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Senior
Advisor

Goodrich
Maggie

0.50

 IT status call

Total 1.50
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 10.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Joshua Grossman

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 10.80

03/08/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Joshua
Grossman

3.00

 Drafting memo with proposed analyses of BPD policing data

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Joshua
Grossman

1.00

 Memo prep

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Joshua
Grossman

3.80

 Sampling strategy meeting, sampling strategy analysis and memo prep

03/23/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Joshua
Grossman

2.00

 sampling strategy memo prep

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Joshua
Grossman

1.00

 Sampling strategy coding and simulation

Total 10.80
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 6.60 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Emily Gunston

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 6.60

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

1.00

 UOF assessment meeting

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.40

 weekly outcome assessments call

03/08/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.50

 call to discuss misconduct assessment

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.50

 reviewed misconduct assessment report

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.50

 weekly assessment call

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.50

 review MOU re Baltimore schools

03/15/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.70

 review BCPS/BPD MOU for compliance with agreement; draft paragraph for report

Total 6.60
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03/19/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.30

 weekly assessments call

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.90

 Monthly Youth Call

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

0.30

 MT Weekly meeting

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Emily
Gunston

1.00

 CIT call

Total 6.60

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Page 2 of 2



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 16.10 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Joyce Nola

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 16.10

03/04/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.80

 Meeting with parties on sexual assault investigations.

03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.40

 Write report to the Court on supervision.

03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.30

 Prep and meeting with parties on the revised staffing plan.

03/07/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

6.00

 Preparation and attendance at the Court meeting.

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.30

 Meeting with parties on recruitments and OSW and follow-up.

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

2.30

 Prep and TA on sexual assault investigations with parties.

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.70

 Review of monitoring plan for EIS.

Total 16.10
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03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.10

 Review of consent decree dashboard with parties.

03/20/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.50

 Meeting with parties on community policing and a call with Shannon Sullivan.

03/20/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.70

 Review and comment on community policing PDM

Total 16.10

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$150.6503/07/2024

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget
Category Mileage
Person Joyce Nola

Attendance at the monthly court meeting. [230.0
miles]

Page 7 of 15



Page 8 of 15



Page 9 of 15



Page 10 of 15



Page 11 of 15



Page 12 of 15



$28.0003/07/2024

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget
Category Other
Person Joyce Nola

Parking
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$51.7503/07/2024

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project BPD July 2023 - June 2024 Budget
Category Meals
Person Joyce Nola

Per diem for travel day.
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 30.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team McDonough Megan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 16.70

03/07/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.80

 Draft youth assessment

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.90

 Youth assessment logistics and communication

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.60

 youth assessment draft

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.60

 Weekly assessment call

03/13/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.10

 Youth assessment logistics and writing

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

 Monthly Youth Call

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.20

 Transport sustainment

Total 30.90
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03/25/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.90

 Youth assessment correspondence and drafting

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.20

 Youth assessment correspondence and drafting

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

 MT Weekly meeting

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

3.00

 Youth assessment correspondence and drafting

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.30

 Youth assessment correspondence and drafting

Pro Bono Hours 0.50

03/04/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

 Internal assessment correspondence

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

 Assessment correspondence and scheduling

03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

 Assessment correspondence and scheduling

Transportation of Persons in Custody Assessment 0.40

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.40

 Monthly transport meeting

Youth Assessment 13.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 30.90
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03/13/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

 Lieutenant interview

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.60

 Sergeant focus group

03/14/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.00

 Correspondence and drafting

03/15/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.30

 Correspondence and drafting

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.50

 Correspondence and drafting

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

 Correspondence and drafting

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

 Sergeants focus group

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.60

 Lieutenants Focus Group #2

03/22/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June
2024 Budget

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

2.60

 Correspondence and drafting; call with G. Cordner, Danielle

Total 30.90

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 13.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Meares Tracey

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Arrests Assessment 0.90

03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.90

 Arrest Assessment

SSA/Impartial Policing Preliminary Review 2.90

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.90

 Impartial Policing Preliminary Review

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.00

 Impartial Policing Preliminary Review

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.00

 Impartial Policing Preliminary Review

Stop and Search Assessment 1.00

03/19/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.00

 Stop and Search Assessment

Training Assessment 8.50

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

7.00

 Training Assessment

Total 13.30
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03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.50

 Training Assessment

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.30

 Training Assessment

03/22/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.70

 Training Assessment

Total 13.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 25.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Ramsey Charles

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 25.50

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

0.50

 Conference call check-in with Commissioner Worley

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 Review BPD OIS

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 Training call

03/06/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 NPP Pilot call

03/15/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

2.50

 Review draft 7 year report

03/15/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 Discuss Judge Bredar's concern about specialized units incommunity engagement with Commissioner Worley

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 Conference call to review BPD CD Dashboard.

Total 25.50
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03/20/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

0.50

 CP Conference call

03/22/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

 Review and comment on BPD Training

03/23/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

3.00

 Review and comment on 7 year MT plan

03/26/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

7.00

 Observe BPD NCO Training

03/27/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Ramsey
Charles

6.00

 NCO Training Day 2

Total 25.50

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 1.40 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Ravi Shroff

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 1.40

03/08/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Ravi
Shroff

0.40

 call with Josh to discuss memo of planned analyses

03/10/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Ravi
Shroff

0.70

 Review of Josh’s draft memo of planned analyses

03/24/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Ravi
Shroff

0.30

 Commenting on Josh's draft memo about efficient sampling strategies

Total 1.40
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 2.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Smoot Sean

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 2.30

03/11/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Smoot
Sean

1.30

 Prep and meeting w BPD and MT re OSW and R&R progress

03/25/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Smoot
Sean

1.00

 Doc correspondence review R&R and OSW.

Total 2.30
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 3.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Terri Wilfong

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Use of Force Assessment 3.00

03/29/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

3.00

 NIC 22-0423, NIC 23-0466

Youth Assessment 0.50

03/10/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

0.50

 Meeting with DOJ discuss Use of Force on Youth case

Total 3.50
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 03/01/2024 – 03/31/2024

Total 14.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

Projects All projects

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Villaseñor Roberto

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 10.20

03/01/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

 UOF Methodoly

03/05/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.50

 Youth UOF meeting, Training call, Youth Arrest Survey Instrument call

03/12/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.40

 Transport call

03/13/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

3.10

 PRB and work on Youth, Transport and UOF issues

03/18/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.50

 Work on UOF and phone calls with Evan and Shannon

03/21/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.80

 Youth Check-in call

03/24/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.10

 Review of 7yr Monitoring Plan and various emails

Total 14.00
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03/28/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.80

 Talk with Gabriela about Youth, work on transport policies, review BPD submission on UOF data analysis

Pro Bono Hours 3.80

03/03/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

 Various emails and reading

03/09/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

 Various emails and reading

03/17/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.80

 Various emails and reading

03/30/2024 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2023 - June 2024
Budget

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

 Various emails and reading

Total 14.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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