
 

 

 
June 28, 2023 Kenneth L. Thompson 

T 410.244.7575 
F 410.244.7742 
KLThompson@Venable.com 

 
 

Mayor and City Council of Baltimore  
Attn: Ebony Thompson, City Solicitor  
City Hall, Suite 101 
100 Holliday Street 
Baltimore, MD 21202 
 
Police Department of Baltimore City 
Attn: Richard Worley, Acting Policing Commissioner 
Shannon Sullivan, Director 
242 W 29th Street  
Baltimore, MD 21211-2908 
 
Timothy Mygatt  
Nicole Porter 
U.S. Department of Justice  
Civil Rights Division  
Special Litigation Section  
950 Pennsylvania Ave., NW  
Washington, DC 20530 
 

RE: Baltimore Police Monitoring Team – April Invoice 
 

This document, including attachments, is the invoice of the Baltimore Police Monitoring 
Team (“Team”) for services performed and expenses incurred in April 2023. 

 
Narrative Summary 

 

This invoice accounts for time worked from 04/01/2023 – 4/30/2023, by team 
members Ken Thompson, Evan Shea, Charles Ramsey, Christine Cole, Gabriela Wasileski, 
Hassan Aden, Jessica Drake, Jonathan Smith, Katie Zafft, Maggie Goodrich, Matthew Barge, 
Megan McDonough, Nola Joyce, Randy Dupont, Roberto Villasenor, Sean Smoot, Terri 
Wilfong, Theron Bowman, Tracey Meares, Tyeesha Dixon, and Wanda Watts.  

 
The sum of previously unbilled services and expenses reflected in this invoice is 

$148,412.85 and of the time submitted in this invoice, 67.7 hours, or 13%, were pro bono, or 
unbilled and donated to the City of Baltimore. By recording 13% of its total time pro bono, and 
writing off certain expenses, the Team saved the city a total of $19,629.50.



 

 

 

Work performed in April 2023 included: 
 

 Community outreach and meetings between Monitoring Team members, including 
neighborhood liaisons, and community stakeholders, and collaborations with BPD 
and DOJ regarding coordinated outreach 

 Collaborating with Morgan State University to conduct a second community 
survey and the Munk School and Rose Street Community Center for a second 
custodial arrestee survey 

 Virtual and telephonic meetings regarding Consent Decree requirements on 
stops/searches/ arrests, use of force, interactions with individuals with behavioral 
health disabilities, technology and data collection and maintenance, interactions 
with youth, impartial policing, misconduct investigations and discipline, training, 
sexual assault investigations, First Amendment protected activities, supervision, 
staffing, recruitment, hiring, officer assistance and support, compliance reviews and 
outcome assessments 

 Continuing our comprehensive assessment on compliance with the First 
Amendment in connection with arrests in 2019 – 2022 

 Continuing our comprehensive assessment on arrests from 2019 and 2021 
 Continuing our comprehensive assessment on recruitment, hiring, and retention and our 

comprehensive assessment on transportation 
 Continuing our compliance audit of sexual assault investigations 
 Developing methodologies for assessments on misconduct investigations and 

discipline, interactions with youth, and responses to individuals in crisis 
 Continuing our review of use of force policy revisions 
 Observing/evaluating Comstat meetings 
 Providing technical assistance on implementation of technology reforms, 

including implementation of new Records Management System and a revised 
electronic report form 

 Addressing issues relating to interactions with individuals with behavioral health 
disabilities, including meetings with CPIC, behavioral health system deficiencies 
identified in an analysis of systemic needs, evaluating data on crisis response, and 
BPD’s Crisis Intervention Team 

 Reviewing implementation of community policing plan 
 Meetings and communications with Judge Bredar to inform him and receive his 

feedback about the progress of the project 
 Preparing and updating content for the team’s website 
 Engaging with residents on social media



 

 

Invoice Summary 

 

Invoice Totals 
 
  Previously 

Billed in FY 
2023 

Apr 2023 
Billed 

Fiscal YTD 
Billed 

Services $1,008,899.00 $144,092.50 $1,152,991.50 

Expenses $220,172.78 $4,320.35 $224,493.13 

Total $1,229,071.78 $148,412.85 $1,377,484.63 

 
 
FY 2023 Budget ($119,390.06 + $1,475,000) $1,594,390.06  

Funds Remaining in FY 2023 Budget $216,905.43  

Percentage of Funds Used in FY2023 Budget 86.40% 

Fiscal 2023 YTD Value of Pro Bono Services  $192,680.10  



 

 

Breakdown of Billable Hours & Expenses 
 

April Total Hours Billed 
Hours 

Pro Bono 
Hours 

Total Services 
Billed 

Total Expenses 
Billed  

Thompson 75.30 59.80 15.50 $28,405.00 $0.00 

Shea 79.30 79.30 0.00 $37,667.50 $0.00 

Aden 29.20 25.40 3.80 $5,969.00 $0.00 

Barge 12.30 11.00 1.30 $2,585.00 $298.82 

Bowman 19.00 19.00 0.00 $4,465.00 $0.00 

CJI: Wasileski 28.00 22.00 6.00 $5,170.00 $0.00 

CJI: Zafft  3.00 3.00 0.00 $705.00 $0.00 

Cole 27.80 21.30 6.50 $5,005.50 $944.99 

Dixon 48.90 42.70 6.20 $10,034.50 $0.00 

Drake (CE) 32.50 32.50 0.00 $7,637.50 $576.05 

Dupont 15.60 11.00 4.60 $2,585.00 $0.00 

Goodrich 1.50 1.50 0.00 $352.50 $0.00 

Joyce 6.30 6.30 0.00 $1,480.50 $0.00 

McDonough 14.70 12.10 2.60 $2,843.50 $0.00 

Meares 4.30 4.30 0.00 $1,010.50 $0.00 

Ramsey 17.30 17.30 0.00 $4,065.50 $295.75 

Smith 22.40 18.20 4.20 $4,277.00 $0.00 

Smoot 1.00 1.00 0.00 $235.00 $0.00 

Villasenor 58.80 41.80 17.00 $9,823.00 $2,204.74 

Watts 26.70 26.70 0.00 $6,274.50 $0.00 

Wilfong 14.90 14.90 0.00 $3,501.50 $0.00 

Total 538.80 471.10 67.70 $144,092.50 $4,320.35 

 



 

 

Individual Invoices and Supporting Documentation 
 

The remainder of this invoice includes the individual invoices of all Team members who 
submitted invoices for April 2023, as well as receipts for travel, transportation, accommodations, and 
expenses incurred for website development, and establishment of Team e-mail addresses. 

 
The City and the Team have agreed that Team members who elect to be compensated for meals 

and personal expenses incurred while traveling to Baltimore for work on the project will do so at the 
standard federal per diem rate of $69, with fractions of days billed at 75% of the standard federal per 
diem rate, or $51.75. Some team members have waived or reduced their per diem charges or elected to 
receive them only for some but not all days while traveling to and working in Baltimore. This constitutes 
additional, ongoing savings to the City. 
 

We submit this invoice for approval by the Department of Justice and the City of Baltimore. As 
previously discussed, we ask both parties to review the invoice and get back to us with any comments or 
suggested changes within five days. Once we obtain approval of the invoice, we will submit it to Judge 
James Bredar for his review and approval. 
 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 

Sincerely, 
 

 
Kenneth Thompson 

 



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.

INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: April
INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Thompson

DATE SUBMITTED: 5/5/2023
YEAR: 2023

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate Total

Unbilled 
Hours

April 1 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 
April 2 475.00$              -$                           

April 3 4.7 475.00$              2,232.50$                 0.6

April 4 2.5 475.00$              1,187.50$                 0.8

April 5 4.2 475.00$              1,995.00$                 
April 6 2.4 475.00$              1,140.00$                 1.4

April 7 475.00$              -$                           
April 8 475.00$              -$                           
April 9 475.00$              -$                           
April 10 4.6 475.00$              2,185.00$                 0.7

April 11 4 475.00$              1,900.00$                 

April 12 3.2 475.00$              1,520.00$                 1.3

April 13 7.5 475.00$              3,562.50$                 

April 14 0.4 475.00$              190.00$                    
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Prepare for and attend Public Hearing, including meeting with the Court and parties after the hearing

Description 

Work on 1st Amendment Assessments (1.2); Telephone conference with the Judge re: public hearing 
issues and review documents re: same (.8); prepare for and attend Central District CRC meeting (1)

Work on presentation for Thursday's Public hearing (3.2); conference with E. Shea re: the Community 
Survey and evaluate issues (.4); review materials and provide comments to the court re: Public 
Hearing issues (.4)

Communicate with the Court re: follow up to yesterday's in chambers meeting with the parties

Review multiple communications in connection with the Community Survey and meet with E. Shea 
re: same (.7); review BPD's public hearing presentation (.7); Review punlic hearing materials and 
consult with the court re: same (.4); review notice to file the Monitoring Plan (.8); finalize preparation 
for tomorrow's public hearing (.6)

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Attend and present at the NL annual meeting

Work on 1st Amendment Assessments (2.2); review comments from E. Shea and S. Rosenthal and 
prepare memo to the court re: the Public Hearing (.8); review comments form the parties re: the 6th 
Year Monitoring Plan (.4); review materials in connection with Community Policing and engagement 
in preparation for next week's Public Hearing (.8); review materials in connection with setting up 
meeting with M. Harris to discuss Draft survey (.5)

Continue to review materials in connection with the community survey (.7); review current edits to 
Monitoring Plan and discuss same with E. Shea (.6); continue preparing for next week's public hearing 
(1.2)
Work on 1st Amendment Assessments   
Telephone conference with the Court re: Consent Decree (.4); review 4 Year Review (.8); work on 1st 
Amendment Assessments (1.2)

Work on logistics for Thursday’s Public Hearing; work on administrative 
matters

Work on community engagement schedule; work on logistics for next month’s 
status meeting re: outcome assessments

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.

6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 

Work on logistics for next week's Public Hearing

Work on administrative issues; work on logistics for Public Hearing

Review and work on response to community member re: article in Journal Of 
Law and Policy; work on logistics for next Thursday’s Public Hearing



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

April 15 475.00$              -$                           
April 16 4.3 475.00$              2,042.50$                 
April 17 6.5 475.00$              3,087.50$                 1.2
April 18 3.4 475.00$              1,615.00$                 1.2

April 19 1.5 475.00$              712.50$                    1.3

April 20 2.1 475.00$              997.50$                    0.8

April 21 0.7 475.00$              332.50$                    1.3

April 22 475.00$              -$                           
April 23 475.00$              -$                           
April 24 0.7 475.00$              332.50$                    

April 25 0.8 475.00$              380.00$                    0.6

April 26 2.3 475.00$              1,092.50$                 1.8

April 27 475.00$              -$                           1.2
April 28 475.00$              -$                           1.3

April 29 475.00$              -$                           
April 30 475.00$              -$                           
April 31 475.00$              -$                           

59.8 475.00$              28,405.00$              15.5

Telephone conference with R. Dupont re: revised policies and related protocols (.2); summary review 
of policy 725 (Use of Force Reporting) (.7); review Monitoring Team's Recruitment Compliance 
Assessment Methodology (.6)

Work on Survey issues (.3); review materials re: Youth Interactions, including potential intersection 
with potential curfew policies (.8); review materials in connection with Supervision in preparation for 
net month's monthly meeting (1)
Review DOJ's email and analysis re: curfew intersection with the Consent Decree (.3); review material 
from R. Dupont re: policy review issues (.4)

Work on issues with community survey including multiple communications with E. Shea

Work on logistics for the August Quarterly Hearing; work on administrative 
issues

Work on logistics for next month's monthly meeting, including 
communications with the court

Work on administrative issues

Work on Community Survey issues with E. Shea including review of multiple communications 
between Morgan and the Monitoring Team (.6); review Data Subcommittee notes (.2)

Review methodology and survey data for the Arrest Report including data related to PIB unlawful 
arrests complaints (1.2); work on community survey related issues (.3); review materials related to 
community policing and engagement issues (.8)

Work on 1st Amendment Assessments
Complete 1st Amendment Reviews (5.3); prepare for an attend Garwyn Community meeting (1.2)
Work on survey issues (.7); review CPIC Data Subcommittee notes and check status of policy revisions 
(.6); review and analyze PIB issues in connection with upcoming assessment (.4); multiple 
communications with J. Drake re: focus group issues and participate in telephone conference with her 
re same (.5); prepare for and participate in biweekly community engagement meeting (.5); review 
relevant sections of the monitoring plan re: deliverables (.7)

Work on administrative issues re: Monitoring Plan deadlines
Work on administrative issues; work on logistics for next month's monthly 
meeting

Work on logistics for the May monthly meeting: work on arrangements for the 
All Hands Monitoring Team meeting

Work on administrative issues

Review press inquiry; work on logistics for the May monthly meeting

Work on administrative issues



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
Yes -$                     -$                               
Yes -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  - 28th  ' 18

No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               
No -$                     -$                               

TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 28,405.00$                      
Subtotal Expenses: -$                                  

TOTAL: 28,405.00$                      
Unbilled Hours 15.50

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: KLT



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log January 1 - 31, 2023

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900

Baltimore, MD 21202

INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: April
INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Shea

DATE SUBMITTED: 5/19/2023

YEAR: 2023

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate Total

Unbilled 
Hours

April 1 475.00$              -$                           

April 2 1.2 475.00$              570.00$                    
April 3 1.4 475.00$              665.00$                    
April 4 3.1 475.00$              1,472.50$                 
April 5 3.1 475.00$              1,472.50$                 

April 6 1 475.00$              475.00$                    
April 7 5 475.00$              2,375.00$                 
April 8 2 475.00$              950.00$                    

April 9 475.00$              -$                           

April 10 1 475.00$              475.00$                    
April 11 7 475.00$              3,325.00$                 

April 12 10 475.00$              4,750.00$                 

April 13 9.2 475.00$              4,370.00$                 
April 14 1.5 475.00$              712.50$                    
April 15 1 475.00$              475.00$                    

April 16 475.00$              -$                           
April 17 4.5 475.00$              2,137.50$                 
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Description 

Draft notice re: 6th year plan

Draft notice re: 6th year plan
Conference with Morgan State IUR; conference with K. Thompson re: same; attend weekly call re: 
assessments
Review officer applications for hiring assessment; attend community meeting; draft email re: 
community survey

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Prepare for quarterly hearing
Emails re: survey; call re: Axon records
Notice for monitoring plan; emails re: ID; call re: assessments

Attend quarterly hearing; emails re: community survey

Revise invoice summary

Draft arrest assessment; call with Morgan re: community survey; emails and calls with S. Rosenthal 
re: same

Emails to Morgan State; revise drone policy, emails re: same

Emails re: access to BPD IT systems; prepare notice for monitoring plan; review article re: consent 
decrees
Prepare notice for monitoring plan; conference with K. Thompson re: status and strategy
Draft notice re: 6th year plan

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non-reimbursable.

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in-service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log January 1 - 31, 2023

April 18 3.5 475.00$              1,662.50$                 

April 19 475.00$              -$  
April 20 6 475.00$              2,850.00$                 

April 21 2.1 475.00$              997.50$  
April 22 475.00$              -$  
April 23 475.00$              -$  
April 24 4.2 475.00$              1,995.00$                 
April 25 2.5 475.00$              1,187.50$                 

April 26 4.4 475.00$              2,090.00$                 
April 27 4.6 475.00$              2,185.00$                 
April 28 1 475.00$              475.00$  
April 29 475.00$              -$  
April 30 475.00$              -$  

79.3 475.00$              37,667.50$              0

Review recruitment records (4) conference with J. Bredar and K. Thompson (2)

Draft arrest assessment; call with S. Rosenthal and K. Thompson re: community survey

Draft arrest assessment
Draft arrest assessment; emails re: community survey

Draft arrest assessment; emails re: case administration; review RWOC audit; emails re: same
Conference with K. Thompson re: administrative matters; draft arrest assessment
Conference call re: SSA policy; prepare for same

Draft arrest assessment



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log January 1 - 31, 2023

EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non-Meal 
Description

Non-Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

Yes -$                     -$                               

Yes -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name:  Evan T. Shea Monthly Log January 1 - 31, 2023

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               

No -$                     -$                               
TOTAL: -$                               

Subtotal Time: 37,667.50$                      
Subtotal Expenses: -$                                  

TOTAL: 37,667.50$                      
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: ETS



Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900
Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non‐reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: April

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Bowman
DATE SUBMITTED: 5/6/2023

YEAR: 2023

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day Hours  Rate  Total

Unbilled 
Hours

April 1 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 2 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 3 0.5 235.00$               117.50$                    

April 4 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 5 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 6 5 235.00$               1,175.00$                 

April 7 2 235.00$               470.00$                    

April 8 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 9 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 10 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 11 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 12 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

April 13 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 14 1.4 235.00$               329.00$                    

April 15 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 16 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 17 235.00$               ‐$                           

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in‐service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.

Comments (Unbilled Time)

Meeting‐ Prepared for and Participated in BPD Axon records call with BPD/DOJ

BPD 1st Amendment UOF case reviews

Description 

Co
m
pl
et
e 
th
es
e 

fo
ur
 c
el
ls 
be

fo
re
 

st
ar
tin

g 
sp
re
ad
sh
ee
t. 
 

Ra
te
s a

nd
 o
th
er
 

in
fo
 w
ill
 se

lf‐
po

pu
la
te
.

Meeting ‐ Prepared for and participated in BPD community meeting

Reviewed and responded to 14 messages (5 PIB cases for 1st Amendment review, Current 
Monitoring Plan Draft, Quarterly Community Forum, Draft Policy 1512, Small Unmanned Aircraft 
System)

Reviewed and responded to 20 messages (Current Monitoring Plan Draft, IA Pro Acess, Transforming 
BPD Newsletter, Draft Policy, Axon Records SSA Monthly Data Meeting, SSA Policy re‐reviews)



April 18 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 19 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 20 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 21 2 235.00$               470.00$                    

April 22 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 23 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 24 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 25 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 26 235.00$               ‐$                           
April 27 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 28 0.8 235.00$               188.00$                    

April 29 2.3 235.00$               540.50$                    

April 30 4 235.00$               940.00$                    

19 4,465.00$                  0

Reviewed and Responded to 23Messages (SSA training call, SSA policies, August Quarterly Hearing, 
Transforming BPD Newsletter, New Dates/Times for Focus Groups)

BAL 1st Amendment case reviews

Meeting‐ Prepared for and participated in BAL SSA Policy and Training Meeting

Reviewed and responded to 22 messages (PIB misconduct cases for 1st Amendment review, Tuesday 
training cll ‐ SSA)



EXPENSES

Date Category Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non‐Meal 
Description

Non‐Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               
TOTAL: ‐$                               

Subtotal Time: 4,465.00$                         
Subtotal Expenses: ‐$                                  

TOTAL: 4,465.00$                         
Unbilled Hours 0.00

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate:



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor INSTRUCTIONS

750 E. Pratt, Ste 900

Baltimore, MD 21202

4.  You may NOT bill for time spent traveling to or from Baltimore or anywhere else.  Travel time is non‐reimbursable.
INVOICE FOR MONTH OF: April

INVOICE SUBMITTED BY: Dupont
DATE SUBMITTED: 5/8/2023

YEAR: 2023

Sample Description:

TIME 
Month of Day  Rate  Total

Unbilled 
Hours

April 1 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 2 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 3 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 4 235.00$               ‐$                            1

April 5 0.1 235.00$               23.50$                      

April 6 2.3 235.00$               540.50$                    

April 7 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 8 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 9 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 10 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 11 1 235.00$               235.00$                    

April 12 235.00$               ‐$                           

Description 

Co
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e 
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g 
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s a
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 w
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 se

lf‐
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te
.

Review of BPD revised policies.  Discussion of Montoring Team evaluation methods with Parties

Discussion of CPIC Meeting with CPIC member

Meeting with Consent Decree Parties, including preparation time and review of BPD policies

Comments (Unbilled Time)

1. Complete the blue box to the left first.  This will cause month and rate information to populate the spreadsheet.

2. Enter descriptions and hours in the "Time" portion of the matrix consistent with the "Sample Description" below.

3. You may not bill more than eight (8) hours in a day, even if you work more than eight (8) hours in a day, which you inevitably 
will.   Leadership must authorize more than eight hours billed in a day, itemized, but will do so sparingly. All time above 8 hours in 
a day should be reflected as "unbilled."

5. Please make sure all expenses meet the Guidelines listed in the Billing Guidelines tab.
6. Do not forget to initial the box attesting to the accuracy of this statement before you submit it.
7. Do not hesitate to call Deputy Monitors Hassan Aden or Seth Rosenthal with any questions.

Prepare for and attend meeting with BPD North Division DC; prepare checklist for review of in‐service training; meet with Ms. 
Williams re changes to compliance matrix; copied use of force reports; reviewed UNDF reports 1123454 and 1123455. 

Meeting with Montoring Team Methods Group (J. Smith and G. Wasileski)



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

April 13 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 14 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 15 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 16 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 17 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 18 0.5 235.00$               117.50$                     0.7

April 19 0.4 235.00$               94.00$                       0.3

April 20 1.2 235.00$               282.00$                    

April 21 0.8 235.00$               188.00$                     0.1

April 22 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 23 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 24 1.3 235.00$               305.50$                    

April 25 2 235.00$               470.00$                     1

April 26 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 27 1.4 235.00$               329.00$                     1.5

April 28 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 29 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 30 235.00$               ‐$                           

April 31 235.00$               ‐$                           

11.00 235.00$               2,585.00$                  4.6

Meeting with state government agency on Consent Decree progress and system integration including 
preparation time

BPD/City CPIC (BHC) policy meeting, including preparation time

BPD/City/DOJ Behavioral Health Meeting to assess progress, including prepartion time

Discussion of Behavioral Health integration efforts with local advocate

Meeting with state government agency on Consent Decree progress and system integration

Discusison of BPD revised policy with local advocate, meeting with Consent Decree Parties

Review of Monitoring Team methodology with MT members (J. Smith and G. Wasileski)

Meeting with Monitoring Team Methods Group (J. Smith and G Wasileski) 
including preparation time

 Meeting with Monitoring Team Methods Group (J. Smith and G. Wasileski)

Meeting with Monitor (K. Thompson) to discuss revised BPD Policy meetings

Meeting with Monitor (K. Thompson) to discuss revised BPD Policy meetings

Meeting with Monitoring Team Methods Group (J. Smith and G Wasileski) 
including preparation time



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

EXPENSES

Date Category Vendor Comment Travel Day

Total Meal + 
Incidentals (per 
daily Guidelines 
cap of $71 per 

day)

Non‐Meal 
Description

Non‐Meal 
Expense

Total

Yes  mileage  ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                      airfare  ‐$                               

Yes ‐$                      taxi  ‐$                               

Yes  per diem 

No 69.00$                  per diem 

Yes ‐$                      hotel 

Yes ‐$                      per diem 

Yes ‐$                      taxi 

Yes #REF!  mileage 

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

MEALS + INCIDENTALS NON MEALS



Name: Weekly Log September 17th  ‐ 28th  ' 18

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               

No ‐$                     ‐$                               
TOTAL: ‐$                               

Subtotal Time: 2,585.00$                         
Subtotal Expenses: ‐$                                   Vendor #992110

TOTAL: 2,585.00$                         
Unbilled Hours 4.60 Invoice #105‐067

INITIALS
Your initials here signify that the charges on this invoice are  accurate: RTD
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WATTSLINE 

WANDAWATTS 

1402 N. Decker Avenue 

Baltimore, Md 21213-3902 

443-540-7193 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Invoice ID 

Issue Date 

Due Date 

The Wattsline - Invoice April 2023 
 

05/04/2023 
 

06/03/2023 (Net 30) 

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent 

Decree: Neighborhood 

Liaisons 

Subject Invoice - April 2023 

 
 
 
 

Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/01/2023 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Wanda 

Watts: Yearly NL Meeting with Monitors at Venable 

 

4.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$940.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/03/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Jason and Wanda - Harvest Training (invoicing) 

 

2.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$470.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/04/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: BPD and DOJ Community Engagement Monthly 

Meeting 

 

0.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$117.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/04/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Focus Group with Jessica Drake at 2901 Druid Park Dr 

 

2.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$470.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/05/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Bi-Weekly Youth Diversion Workgroup - need to 

workout transpo issues with new providers in East Baltimore 

who are expected to serve West Balto youth 

 

0.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$117.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/10/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Central District CRC/Commanders Meeting 

 

1.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$235.00 
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Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/12/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Quarterly Community Forum 

 

1.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$352.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/13/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Quarterly Hearing 

 

5.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$1,175.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/17/2023 - Neighborhood Liaisons / Wanda 

Watts: NL MONTHLY MEETING 

 

1.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$235.00 
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Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/17/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Garrison Hill Community Association 

 

1.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$235.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/18/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Bi-weekly Monitor Call 

 

0.20 
 

$235.00 
 

$47.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/18/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: TRANSFER FB LIVE TO YOU TUBE (instructions) 

 

0.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$117.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/20/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Instructions for transferring FB to Archive on YouTube 

 

0.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$117.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/25/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Eastern District Commanders Meeting 

 

1.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$352.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/26/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: ABC Mondawmin Community Conversation 

 

1.20 
 

$235.00 
 

$282.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/27/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Eastern District CRC/Commanders Meeting 

 

1.50 
 

$235.00 
 

$352.50 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/28/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Drug-Free Baltimore Coalition 

 

1.00 
 

$235.00 
 

$235.00 

 

Service 
 

Wattsline - 04/28/2023 - Community Engagement / Wanda 

Watts: Graphics for focus group, email and social mediaI 

 

1.80 
 

$235.00 
 

$423.00 

 

Amount Due $6,274.50 



Item Type Description Quantity Unit Price Amount

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Aden Hassan
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

25.40 $235.00 $5,969.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Barge Matthew
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

11.00 $235.00 $2,585.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Christine Cole
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

21.30 $235.00 $5,005.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

22.00 $235.00 $5,170.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: CJI - Zafft Katie
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

3.00 $235.00 $705.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Drake Jessica
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

32.50 $235.00 $7,637.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Goodrich Maggie
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.50 $235.00 $352.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Jonathan Smith
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

18.20 $235.00 $4,277.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Joyce Nola
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

6.30 $235.00 $1,480.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: McDonough Megan
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

12.10 $235.00 $2,843.50

From 21CP Solutions, LLC
332 S Michigan Ave. 
Suite 1032 – T615 
Chicago, IL 60604-4434 
(844) 767-2127

Invoice For Baltimore City Consent
Decree: Monitoring Team
Baltimore Consent Decree Monitor 
750 E. Pratt, Suite 900 
Baltimore, MD 21202

Invoice ID Baltimore Monitor April 2023 Invoice

Issue Date 05/15/2023

Due Date 06/14/2023 (Net 30)
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Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Meares Tracey
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

4.30 $235.00 $1,010.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Ramsey Charles
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

17.30 $235.00 $4,065.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Smoot Sean
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $235.00 $235.00

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Terri Wilfong
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

14.90 $235.00 $3,501.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Tyeesha Dixon
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

42.70 $235.00 $10,034.50

Service BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Villaseñor Roberto
(04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

41.80 $235.00 $9,823.00

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for Barge
Matthew (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $298.82 $298.82

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for
Christine Cole (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $944.99 $944.99

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for Drake
Jessica (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $576.05 $576.05

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for
Ramsey Charles (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $295.75 $295.75

Product BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year: Expenses for
Villaseñor Roberto (04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023)

1.00 $2,204.74 $2,204.74

Amount Due $69,015.85
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 29.20 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Aden Hassan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 25.40

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.80

 Troubleshooting MT members' access problems to IAPro as we are ready to launch the Misconduct and Discipline
Compliance Assessment. Review of the 6th Year MT Plan DOJ comments/corrections. Outcome Assessment
workgroup weekly call. Email and correspondence related to project management and various CD related matters.

04/06/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.50

 Participated in the weekly Compstat and Crimes meetings. Email and correspondence. Review of several CD
related articles.

04/07/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.80

 Review and preparation of presentation for the public hearing on 4/13/2023 and the Community Forum on
4/12/2023. Email and correspondence and project management.

04/10/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.00

 Email and correspondence re: various meetings, assessments and court proceedings this week. Project
management.

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

1.50

 Review and preparation for the Community Forum. Participated in the Community Forum re: Use of Force,
Community Policing and Misconduct and Discipline.

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

8.00

 Preparation, review and attendance at the Court Public Hearing re CD progress. Email and correspondence.

Total 29.20
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04/14/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.80

 Call with M. Barge re: Court presentations and outcome assessments. Email and correspondence.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.50

 Call with K. Thompson re CD related matters. Email and correspondence.

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.70

 Review of DOJ's comments and feedback on the PIB Assessment methodology and instruments. Correspondence
with Outcome Assessment workgroup re: upcoming assessments and staffing for the next monitoring year. Email
and correspondence.

04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

3.30

 Outcome assessment correspondence and project management. Participated in the CompStat and Crimes
meeting. Email and correspondence.

04/24/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.50

 Email and correspondence regarding logistics for the All-Team meeting and court meeting in May. PIB related
emails.

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

2.00

 Participated in the weekly CompStat and Crimes meeting. Email, correspondence and logistics re CD related
matters and the upcoming All-team meeting and court hearing.

Pro Bono Hours 3.80

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

0.80

 Email and correspondence.

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Aden
Hassan

3.00

 Travel to and from Baltimore for the Public Hearing.

Total 29.20

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 12.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Barge Matthew

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 11.00

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.90

 Review and edit sexual assault investigation baseline assessment; email communication w/ K. Zafft, N. Joyce re:
same. Participate in weekly conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.20

 Review and provide feedback re: youth outcome assessment methodology; email communications w/ T. Dixon, R.
Villaseñor, G. Wasileski re: same. Various email communications w/ MT re: crisis intervention outcome
assessment; revise, format electronic assessment instrument re: same. Continue drafting Performance Review
Board assessment; analyze data re: same; email communications w/ R. Villaseñor re: same.

04/07/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.30

 Continue drafting Performance Review Board assessment; analyze data re: same: email communication w/ G.
Wasileski, K. Zafft re: same. Email communications w/ outcome assessment team re: electronic assessment
platform topics.

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.70

 Email communications w/ K. Thompson, E. Shea, S. Rosenthal re: quarterly hearing. Participate in weekly
conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: training; various email communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: same. Email
communications w/ DOJ, MT re: misconduct assessment methodology. Participate in weekly MT conference call
re: outcome assessments.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

2.30

 Email communications w/ E. Shea re: arrest assessment; w/ MT, DOJ re: misconduct assessment; w/ K.
Thompson re: stop, search, and arrest assessment. Conference call w/ G. Wasileski, R. Dupont, J. Smith re: crisis
intervention outcome assessment. Continue drafting PRB assessment; email communications w/ R. Villaseñor re:
same. Participate in weekly conference call w/ MT re: outcome assessments.

Total 12.30
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04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

1.60

 Conference call w/ N. Porter, D. Cooper, J. Smith, G. Wasileski re: PIB/misconduct assessment methodology.
Conference call w/ S. Sullivan, S. Hohman, M. Krafchik, M. Riaz, R. Villaseñor re: use of force policy revisions.

Pro Bono Hours 1.30

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.40

 Participate in monthly conference call w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: SSA data.

04/06/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.40

 Conference call w/ R. Villaseñor re: PRB assessment. Various email communications w/ MT, Parties re: use of
force policies, outcome assessments.

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.20

 Review monitoring plan. Various email communications w/ E. Shea re: monitoring plan, outcome assessments; w/
C. Cole re: recruitment/hiring assessment; w/ E. Shea, M. McDonough, S. Rosenthal, K. Thompson re: community
survey.

04/14/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.20

 Conference call w/ H. Aden re: 4/13 court hearing, monitoring plan.

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Barge
Matthew

0.10

 Various email communications w/ BPD, DOJ, MT re: outcome assessments, officer safety and wellness
assessment, training.

Total 12.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Expense report for
Invoice Baltimore
Monitor April 2023
Invoice

21CP Solutions, LLC

$6.0004/05/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Additional Google/email charge (separate charge
1 of 2).
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$6.0004/05/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Additional Google/email charge (separate charge
2 of 2).
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$168.0004/09/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Squarespace/GSuite BPD Monitor email charges.

$29.0004/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Squarespace BPDMonitor.com website monthly
charges.
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$89.8204/17/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Phone, Internet, Website Expenses
Person Barge Matthew

Electronic assessment platform charges. (1/2 of
overall invoice amount).
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 28.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Wasileski Gabriela

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 22.00

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

MT weekly meeting, CIT methodology review

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

1.00

MT weekly meeting,

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

AXON training site to review Stop and Searches data collection

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

1st Amendment Outcome Assessment meeting, coordination with the reviews and BPD,

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

3.00

CIT Check in - discussion related to the data and items needed, meeting with 1st Amendment reviewer, MT weekly
meeting

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

1.00

Youth Interaction OA methodology, meeting with DOJ

04/21/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

3.00

Total 28.00
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1at Amendment data collection coordination, CAD data cleaning for the CIT OA

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

3.00

CIT regular check in, methodology review and comments, analysis of 4th Amendment data

04/29/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

5.00

Behavioral health data cleaning and coding. CIT Methodology editing and meeting. 1st Amendment data
collection. Youth data cleaning for the sampling

Pro Bono Hours 6.00

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

1st Amendment data coding and cleaning.

04/24/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

2.00

meeting with BPD regarding the AXON data entry for the behavioral heath forms

04/25/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

1.00

CIT data cleaning and methodology review

04/26/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Wasileski
Gabriela

1.00

Youth interaction and community policing data collection

Total 28.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 3.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team CJI - Zafft Katie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 3.00

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

1.00

Assessment team call to discuss assessment status updates

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

CJI - Zafft
Katie

2.00

assessment team status update call (1 hour), edits to sexual assault draft report (1 hour)

Total 3.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 27.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Christine Cole

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Pro Bono Hours 6.50

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

3.00

Travel

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.50

Appreciation notes via email, planning next steps via email

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

3.00

Travel

Recruitment Assessment 21.30

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.00

Join bi-weekly call with BPD and MT on OSW and R&R.

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.00

Conversation with OO and AC and follow-up on logistics for next week's recruit background assessment.

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.00

Join assessment team meeting.

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.60

Total 27.80
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Comms with other reviewers, sharing materials, setting up esoph account.

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

1.00

Join weekly assessment team meeting.

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

9.50

on site review of background investigations

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.80

Discussion with Megan on memo and data

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.80

Meeting with Freddie on data, process, and next steps.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

0.70

Join Assessment Team call.

04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Christine
Cole

4.90

Working in eSoph on reviews.

Total 27.80

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$48.4704/11/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

taxi BWI to Hotel
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$51.7504/11/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

Per Diem Travel Day

$69.0004/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Christine Cole

per diem for 4/12

$354.8604/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Lodging
Person Christine Cole

Hotel Expense
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$35.3504/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

Uber from Hotel to BWI
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$257.8104/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Christine Cole

AA flight from BOS to BWI return
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$76.0004/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Other
Person Christine Cole

parking at BOS
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 32.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Drake Jessica

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 10.00

04/01/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

4.50

NL Annual Meeting and coordination

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

0.50

Focus group coordination and emails.

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

0.50

Call with W. Watts.

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

Quarterly Community Forum

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.50

Monthly NL call and update with CDIU

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

Standing CE Call and follow up communications- re: CJSJ

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

Total 32.50
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Standing Community Policing call

CPOP Assessment 9.00

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.00

Focus group for CPOP Assessment and call with W/ Watts.

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

1.00

Focus group communications and coordination

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.00

Prep, focus group re: CPOP Assessment. Emails and communication re: assessments

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.00

Focus group with CJSJ and follow up with T. Dixon

04/24/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

2.00

Gathering Data for Community Listening Group

Recruitment Assessment 13.50

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

9.50

Assessments: Recruitment and Hiring Background Checks audit

04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Drake
Jessica

4.00

Recruitment Assessment review work.

Total 32.50

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$397.5504/01/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Drake Jessica

Lunch for NL's at Venable
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$28.0004/01/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Drake Jessica

Parking at Venable

$35.0004/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Drake Jessica

Garage for Court

$51.7504/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Drake Jessica

Travel Per Diem

$12.0004/14/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Drake Jessica

Parking for BPD Community Training
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$51.7504/14/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Drake Jessica

Travel Day Per Diem

04/13/2023
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 1.50 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Goodrich Maggie

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 1.50

04/10/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Goodrich
Maggie

0.50

IT Status meeting with parties

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Senior
Advisor

Goodrich
Maggie

1.00

BPD IT optimization meeting

Total 1.50

Page 1 of 1



Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 22.40 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Jonathan Smith

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

CPOP Assessment 3.20

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.90

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.20

Draft correspondence to Major Loeffler.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.90

Conf call with Dupont, Barge, Wasileski

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.60

Monitoring Team Meeting

04/30/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.60

Finalize crisis intervention document request and Transmit to BPD.

Misconduct Investigations Assessment 15.00

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.50

Meeting with DOJ re: Outcome assessment

     Baltimore City Consent Decree: 
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

8.50

Total 22.40
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Ride along with CIT Officer

04/24/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.90

Bi-weekly PIB meeting DOJ, BPD, and monitoring team.

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

0.40

Conference call with Stephen Manik to follow-up on call.

04/25/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

2.00

Draft document request

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

1.00

Conf Call with Dupont and Wasileski regarding document request for CIT Assessment

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

1.70

Travel to Baltimore for Background check and fingerprinting. Half billed to pro bono

Pro Bono Hours 4.20

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

2.50

Travel to and from Baltimore

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Jonathan
Smith

1.70

Travel to Baltimore for fingerprinting and background check.

Total 22.40

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 6.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Joyce Nola

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 6.30

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.00

Recruitment and Retention call with parties to discuss progress, issues, and next steps.

Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.60

Call on staffing with the parties to discuss progress, issues, and next steps.

04/07/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.60

Review and comment on the draft Outcome Assessment and Audit of Sexual Assault Investigations.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

1.60

CJSJ Focus Group for community policing assessment.

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.50

Meeting with partners about community engagement and policing to discuss progress, issues, and next steps.

04/25/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.50

Review of proposed case study for SA investigator training and review of OSW Annual Report.

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Joyce
Nola

0.50

Total 6.30
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Review and comment on OSW Annual Report.

Total 6.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 14.70 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team McDonough Megan

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 6.10

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

Assessment team meeting.

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

Community survey call with IUR

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.00

Outcome assessment team call.

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.90

Touch base with Christine Cole re: assessments.

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Email correspondence re: assessments

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.80

Ad hoc community survey budget meeting.

04/26/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.10

Total 14.70
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Assessment correspondence; officer wellness follow up assessment methodology.

Pro Bono Hours 2.60

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Community survey correspondence with MT.

04/09/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.30

Review documents ahead of call with IUR.

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Community survey correspondence and memorialization of meeting

04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Call with R. Villasenor re: transport assessment.

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.50

Update methodology for T2

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.10

Call with BPD re: transport data

Transportation of Persons in Custody Assessment 6.00

04/08/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.30

Review monthly scorecards and develop follow-up methodology.

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

0.70

Update methodology for T2

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.40

Update methodology for T2.

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 14.70
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04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.10

Update methodology for T2

04/21/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

McDonough
Megan

1.50

Update methodology for T2.

Total 14.70

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 4.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Meares Tracey

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Arrests Assessment 4.30

04/01/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.50

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.30

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

1.00

04/30/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Meares
Tracey

0.50

Total 4.30
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 17.30 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Ramsey Charles

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 16.30

04/01/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

2.00

NL Conference

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

0.50

Conference call Commissioner Harrison

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

Quarterly Community Forum

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

8.00

Court Appearance and preparation

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

NL Monthly Conference Call

04/21/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

Conference Call with Commissioner Harrison

04/26/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

0.80

Total 17.30
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Conference call with Commissioner Harrison.

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

2.00

Review 1st Amendment activity reports

Use of Force Assessment 1.00

04/10/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Ramsey
Charles

1.00

Review UoF case.

Total 17.30

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$244.00

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Ramsey Charles

Amtrak Ticket for Monthly Court Hearing
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$51.7504/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Ramsey Charles

Travel Per Diem

04/10/2023
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 1.00 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Smoot Sean

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Partner Professional Fees 1.00

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Partner Smoot
Sean

1.00

Recruitment and Retention call w/BOD and DOJ.

Total 1.00
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 14.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Terri Wilfong

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

First Amendment Protected Activities Assessment 14.90

04/02/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

1.80

3B02440959 Sid 4001964

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

3.30

2B02416185, 2B02407484

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

3.40

0B02431779

04/23/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

2.50

1-200600263

04/29/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Terri
Wilfong

3.90

5-30-20 Protest Surveillance
5-30-20 Protest Surveillance
5-30-20 Downtown Protests
5-30-20 Downtown Protests
5-30-20 Downtown Protests (2)
5-30-20 Downtown Protests (2)
Protesters (2) 5-30-20 
Protesters (3) 5-30-20 
Protesters (4) 5-30-20 

Total 14.90
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 48.90 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Tyeesha Dixon

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Associate Consultant Professional Fees 16.30

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.00

Weekly meeting for outcome assessment leads

     Baltimore City Consent Decree: 
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

5.70

Draft survey instrument for youth section assessment methodology; attend biweekly youth check in call with BPD
and DOJ to discuss assessment methodology

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.70

Review MT edits to draft youth assessment methodology and revise

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.00

Weekly meeting for outcome assessment leads

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.80

Revise draft youth assessment methodology; emails with parties regarding same

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.50

Attend public hearing by phone

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

2.00

Total 48.90
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Review DOJ's comments on draft youth assessment methodology; emails with MT regarding same

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.60

Weekly meeting for outcome assessment leads.

     Baltimore City Consent Decree: 
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.70

Review DOJ's comments on draft youth assessment methodology; meet and confer with parties regarding draft
youth assessment methodology

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.30

Review produced data to determine sampling methodology for youth assessment; call with MT re: youth
assessment methodology data

CPOP Assessment 26.40

04/01/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

2.00

Attend Neighborhood Liaison meeting

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.40

Call with J. Drake re: planning for community focus groups

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

4.50

Review BPD's assessment document productions

04/05/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.00

Plan community focus groups; emails with MT regarding same

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

3.20

Attend two virtual community focus groups

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.70

Attend community focus group; debrief with MT

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 48.90

Page 2 of 3



04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

4.00

Review BPD's assessment document productions

04/24/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

1.00

Call with MT re: assessment data production

04/25/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

2.00

Meet and confer with parties re: draft youth assessment methodology; revise draft youth assessment methodology

04/26/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.50

Prepare for community focus groups

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

0.90

Call with MT and University of Baltimore re: Neighborhood Policing Plan evaluation

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

2.20

Planning for officer/supervisor focus groups and interviews

Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

3.00

Draft questionnaires and protocols for officer and supervisor focus groups and interviews

Pro Bono Hours 6.20

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

3.20

Review academic literature regarding youth-related assessment sampling methodologies

04/21/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Associate
Consultant

Tyeesha
Dixon

3.00

Review best practice literature regarding youth-related assessment sampling methodologies

Total 48.90

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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Detailed time report 21CP Solutions, LLC

Timeframe 04/01/2023 – 04/30/2023

Total 58.80 Hours
0.00 Uninvoiced billable hours

1 Client Baltimore City Consent Decree: Monitoring
Team

1
Project

BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget Year

Tasks All tasks

1 Team Villaseñor Roberto

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

First Amendment Protected Activities Assessment 6.10

04/02/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.00

Work on 1st Amendment assessments 3685297, 3791362.

04/03/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.10

1st Amendment assessments 5017654, 151734, 4921383.

04/04/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.00

Youth Meeting, 1st Amendment assessment 4970315, 4822484.

Misconduct Investigations Assessment 5.00

04/22/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.40

PIB Arrest reviews 19-474647

04/27/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.30

Review PIB arrest 2020-0305

04/28/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

2.20

Review PIB arrest 2020-0486, 2020-0487

04/29/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.10

Total 58.80
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PIB review 2020-0704

Partner Professional Fees 30.70

04/11/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

On sight visit to conduct Transport Audits. Training call. Discuss curfew issue with DC Melancon.

04/12/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

On-site visit. Attend funeral for deceased Commander. Observe from OSW perspective. Work on arrest
assessments. Attend Community forum and report on UOF.

04/13/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

On-site for Quarterly Court Hearing - Use of Force. Speak with Judge about Youth and curfew issue.

04/17/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.60

Work on Youth Assessment.

04/18/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Youth call

04/19/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.10

Discussion on updated use of force policies.

04/20/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

0.70

Meeting with Megan regarding transport.

04/25/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.60

Weekly training call and youth call.

04/26/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.70

PRB

Pro Bono Hours 17.00

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours

Total 58.80
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04/01/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

1.00

Various emails and reading

04/10/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Travel to Baltimore.

04/14/2023 Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

BPD July 2022 - June 2023
Budget Year

Partner Villaseñor
Roberto

8.00

Travel home from Baltimore

Total 58.80

Date Client Project Roles Person Hours
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$51.7504/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Ramsey Charles

Travel Per Diem

$32.7504/10/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Mileage
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Mileage to/from airport from/to home [50.0 miles]

$40.0004/10/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Taxi from airport to hotel
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$977.4004/10/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Airfare
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$702.2404/10/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Lodging
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Hotel 4/10/23-4/14/23
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$51.7504/10/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Travel day per diem

$13.6804/11/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber from hotel to HQ
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$22.1204/11/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber from HQ to hotel
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$69.0004/11/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per diem

$11.9604/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber from hotel to HQ
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$8.9504/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber from hotel to dinner
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$14.6904/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber from dinner to hotel
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$69.0004/12/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per diem

$69.0004/13/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Per diem

$37.5004/14/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Uber to airport
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$32.9504/14/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Transportation
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Airport parking
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$51.7504/14/2023

Client
Baltimore City Consent Decree:
Monitoring Team

Project
BPD July 2022 - June 2023 Budget
Year

Category Meals
Person Villaseñor Roberto

Travel day per diem
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